
  

REF. ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

BASE BID (Final Completion of October 30, 2026)

1 SPEC. RISER MANWAY LUMP 1 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $9,800.00 $9,800.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

2 SPEC. WET INTERIOR ROOF HATCH LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

3 SPEC. OVERFLOW PIPE DISCHARGE MODIFICATION LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

4 SPEC. FALL PREVENTION DEVICE LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $1,900.00 $1,900.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $5,600.00 $5,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

5 SPEC. VANDAL GUARD LUMP 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,900.00 $1,900.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

6 SPEC. ROOF PLATFORM LUMP 1 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00

7 SPEC. WET INTERIOR LADDER LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $9,800.00 $9,800.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

8 SPEC. LADDER CAGE REMOVAL LUMP 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

9 SPEC. BALCONY ACCESS MODIFICATION LUMP 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $10,800.00 $10,800.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

10 SPEC. ROOF VENT LUMP 1 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $6,900.00 $6,900.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00

11 SPEC. ROOF HANDRAIL AND PAINTER'S RAILING LUMP 1 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $26,660.00 $26,660.00 $15,600.00 $15,600.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

12 SPEC. RISER GATE LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $5,700.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

13 SPEC. EXTERIOR REPAINT WITH CONTAINMENT LUMP 1 $216,000.00 $216,000.00 $172,000.00 $172,000.00 $179,800.00 $179,800.00 $206,620.00 $206,620.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $253,830.00 $253,830.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $256,700.00 $256,700.00 $297,600.00 $297,600.00 $388,100.00 $388,100.00

14 SPEC. WET INTERIOR REPAINT LUMP 1 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $72,000.00 $72,000.00 $71,200.00 $71,200.00 $90,180.00 $90,180.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $87,000.00 $87,000.00 $127,750.00 $127,750.00 $188,000.00 $188,000.00

15 SPEC. SEAM SEALER LUMP 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

16 SPEC. GROUNDING ROD INSTALLATION LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00

17 SPEC. INSPECTION SERVICES ALLOW. 1 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00

18 SPEC. LETTERING LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 *1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

19 SPEC. LETTERING-ALTERNATE LUMP 1 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 *1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

BASE BID TOTAL $451,700.00 $370,200.00 $370,300.00 $427,300.00 $431,200.00 $451,200.00 $477,130.00 *1 $514,850.00 $516,960.00 $580,650.00 $738,000.00

ALTERNATE BID (Final Completion of June 18, 2027)

1 SPEC. RISER MANWAY LUMP 1 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 No Bid $5,800.00 $5,800.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $9,800.00 $9,800.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $12,400.00 $12,400.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

2 SPEC. WET INTERIOR ROOF HATCH LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 No Bid $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $5,700.00 $5,700.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

3 SPEC. OVERFLOW PIPE DISCHARGE MODIFICATION LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 No Bid $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,800.00 $4,800.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

4 SPEC. FALL PREVENTION DEVICE LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 No Bid $1,900.00 $1,900.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00

5 SPEC. VANDAL GUARD LUMP 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 No Bid $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

6 SPEC. ROOF PLATFORM LUMP 1 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 No Bid $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $18,100.00 $18,100.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00

7 SPEC. WET INTERIOR LADDER LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 No Bid $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $9,800.00 $9,800.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $6,200.00 $6,200.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

8 SPEC. LADDER CAGE REMOVAL LUMP 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 No Bid $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

9 SPEC. BALCONY ACCESS MODIFICATION LUMP 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 No Bid $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $10,800.00 $10,800.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

10 SPEC. ROOF VENT LUMP 1 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 No Bid $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $6,900.00 $6,900.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $11,400.00 $11,400.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00

11 SPEC. ROOF HANDRAIL AND PAINTER'S RAILING LUMP 1 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 No Bid $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $27,500.00 $27,500.00 $15,600.00 $15,600.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

12 SPEC. RISER GATE LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 No Bid $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $5,900.00 $5,900.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00

13 SPEC. EXTERIOR REPAINT WITH CONTAINMENT LUMP 1 $216,000.00 $216,000.00 No Bid $206,620.00 $206,620.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $253,830.00 $253,830.00 $280,000.00 $280,000.00 $264,700.00 $264,700.00 $297,600.00 $297,600.00 $388,100.00 $388,100.00

14 SPEC. WET INTERIOR REPAINT LUMP 1 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 No Bid $90,180.00 $90,180.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $105,000.00 $105,000.00 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $89,700.00 $89,700.00 $127,750.00 $127,750.00 $188,000.00 $188,000.00

15 SPEC. SEAM SEALER LUMP 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 No Bid $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00

16 SPEC. GROUNDING ROD INSTALLATION LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 No Bid $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00

17 SPEC. INSPECTION SERVICES ALLOW. 1 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 No Bid $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00 $48,700.00

18 SPEC. LETTERING LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 No Bid $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $6,200.00 $6,200.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

19 SPEC. LETTERING-ALTERNATE LUMP 1 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 No Bid $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,700.00 $5,700.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00

ALTERNATE BID TOTAL $451,700.00 No Bid $427,300.00 $441,200.00 $451,200.00 $477,130.00 $514,850.00 $532,200.00 $580,650.00 $738,000.00

*1 Addendum not acknowledged. *1 Total given was $468,630.00

*2 Total given was $468,630.00

 

 

 

 

Village of Ansonia

Bid Tabulation

April 8, 2026

Winbigler Street Water Tower Rehabilitation MW Cole Construction LLC

The Villages, FL

Viking Painting, LLC

La Vista, NE

D And Six Sons Painting LLC

Stockbridge, MI

Classic Protective Coatings, Inc.

Menomonie, WI

L.C. United Painting Co., Inc.

Sterling Heights, MI

Seven Brothers Painting, Inc.

Shelby Township, MI

Clearcreek Coatings, LTD.

Medway, OH

D&M Painting Corporation

Washington, PA

BRZ Coatings Inc.

Searcy, AR

Leary Construction Company, Inc.

Greenfield, IN
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