
  
REF. ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

S. 5TH STREET BASE BID
1 201 CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,521.00 $3,521.00 $22,995.00 $22,995.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,336.39 $2,336.39 $1,225.00 $1,225.00
2 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $4,055.00 $4,055.00 $9,950.00 $9,950.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $6,790.19 $6,790.19 $6,125.00 $6,125.00
3 202 BARRIER CURB REMOVED FT. 300 $8.00 $2,400.00 $12.00 $3,600.00 $6.00 $1,800.00 $8.00 $2,400.00 $6.00 $1,800.00 $8.85 $2,655.00 $13.00 $3,900.00
4 202 CURB AND GUTTER REMOVED FT. 26 $12.00 $312.00 $12.00 $312.00 $12.00 $312.00 $11.00 $286.00 $6.00 $156.00 $14.39 $374.14 $25.00 $650.00
5 202 WALK REMOVED S.F. 1008 $5.00 $5,040.00 $6.50 $6,552.00 $1.00 $1,008.00 $1.90 $1,915.20 $2.00 $2,016.00 $2.08 $2,096.64 $4.00 $4,032.00
6 202 METER PIT REMOVED EACH 1 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $308.00 $308.00 $375.00 $375.00 $300.00 $300.00 $617.36 $617.36 $615.00 $615.00
7 202 VALVE BOX REMOVED EACH 2 $250.00 $500.00 $300.00 $600.00 $305.00 $610.00 $275.00 $550.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $300.02 $600.04 $310.00 $620.00
8 203 EXCAVATION, INCLUDING EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 80 $18.00 $1,440.00 $35.00 $2,800.00 $25.00 $2,000.00 $72.00 $5,760.00 $30.00 $2,400.00 $33.26 $2,660.80 $100.00 $8,000.00
9 204 EXCAVATION OF SUBGRADE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 10 $95.00 $950.00 $40.00 $400.00 $111.00 $1,110.00 $41.00 $410.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $90.18 $901.80 $125.00 $1,250.00

10 204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 245 $6.00 $1,470.00 $2.00 $490.00 $2.00 $490.00 $2.00 $490.00 $1.00 $245.00 $0.70 $171.50 $3.00 $735.00
11 254 4" PAVEMENT PLANING, ASPHALT CONCRETE S.Y. 47 $8.00 $376.00 $60.00 $2,820.00 $43.00 $2,021.00 $31.85 $1,496.95 $35.00 $1,645.00 $43.92 $2,064.24 $67.00 $3,149.00
12 304 AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 275 $80.00 $22,000.00 $60.00 $16,500.00 $71.00 $19,525.00 $66.00 $18,150.00 $85.00 $23,375.00 $73.55 $20,226.25 $82.00 $22,550.00
13 407 NON-TRACKING TACK COAT, SURFACE COURSE, APPLIED @ 0.06 GAL./S.Y. GAL. 58 $12.00 $696.00 $12.00 $696.00 $8.00 $464.00 $10.80 $626.40 $7.00 $406.00 $8.51 $493.58 $12.00 $696.00
14 411 STABILIZED CRUSHED AGGREGATE C.Y. 10 $85.00 $850.00 $80.00 $800.00 $80.00 $800.00 $90.00 $900.00 $85.00 $850.00 $74.26 $742.60 $82.00 $820.00
15 441 ASPHALT CONCRETE INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2, (449) C.Y. 67 $350.00 $23,450.00 $550.00 $36,850.00 $490.00 $32,830.00 $337.00 $22,579.00 $400.00 $26,800.00 $531.54 $35,613.18 $550.00 $36,850.00
16 441 ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, (449), PG64-22 C.Y. 40 $375.00 $15,000.00 $480.00 $19,200.00 $541.00 $21,640.00 $442.00 $17,680.00 $410.00 $16,400.00 $548.65 $21,946.00 $550.00 $22,000.00
17 452 6" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 3 $85.00 $255.00 $225.00 $675.00 $617.00 $1,851.00 $225.00 $675.00 $185.00 $555.00 $652.55 $1,957.65 $300.00 $900.00
18 452 8" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 62 $95.00 $5,890.00 $180.00 $11,160.00 $222.00 $13,764.00 $116.00 $7,192.00 $175.00 $10,850.00 $242.52 $15,036.24 $178.00 $11,036.00
19 608 4" CONCRETE WALK, AS PER PLAN S.F. 869 $12.00 $10,428.00 $15.00 $13,035.00 $20.00 $17,380.00 $9.75 $8,472.75 $15.00 $13,035.00 $21.77 $18,918.13 $13.00 $11,297.00
20 608 CURB RAMP, AS PER PLAN S.F. 38 $20.00 $760.00 $49.00 $1,862.00 $103.00 $3,914.00 $32.00 $1,216.00 $37.00 $1,406.00 $108.90 $4,138.20 $25.00 $950.00
21 608 4" CONCRETE WALK FOR PRIVATE UNDERGROUND WATER SERVICE BRANCH 

INSTALLATION, AS PER PLAN S.F. 100 $12.00 $1,200.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $19.00 $1,900.00 $23.94 $2,394.00 $25.00 $2,500.00
22 608 CONCRETE STEPS, TYPE B, FOR PRIVATE UNDERGROUND WATER SERVICE BRANCH 

INSTALLATION, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $50.00 $1,250.00 $290.00 $7,250.00 $247.00 $6,175.00 $166.00 $4,150.00 $305.00 $7,625.00 $257.62 $6,440.50 $250.00 $6,250.00
23 609 TYPE 6 BARRIER CURB, AS PER PLAN FT. 292 $35.00 $10,220.00 $56.00 $16,352.00 $80.00 $23,360.00 $45.00 $13,140.00 $60.00 $17,520.00 $82.15 $23,987.80 $66.00 $19,272.00
24 609 CURB AND GUTTER REPLACED (IN-KIND) FT. 26 $45.00 $1,170.00 $63.00 $1,638.00 $110.00 $2,860.00 $52.00 $1,352.00 $80.00 $2,080.00 $113.32 $2,946.32 $92.00 $2,392.00
25 610 MODULAR RETAINING WALL FOR PRIVATE UNDERGROUND WATER SERVICE BRANCH 

INSTALLATION, AS PER PLAN S.F. 20 $55.00 $1,100.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 $243.00 $4,860.00 $72.00 $1,440.00 $350.00 $7,000.00 $121.12 $2,422.40 $125.00 $2,500.00
26 611 4" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $40.00 $1,000.00 $15.00 $375.00 $1.00 $25.00 $25.00 $625.00 $25.00 $625.00 $26.12 $653.00 $20.00 $500.00
27 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $50.00 $1,250.00 $18.00 $450.00 $1.00 $25.00 $26.00 $650.00 $30.00 $750.00 $32.78 $819.50 $25.00 $625.00
28 611 8" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $60.00 $1,500.00 $26.00 $650.00 $1.00 $25.00 $27.00 $675.00 $36.00 $900.00 $41.70 $1,042.50 $31.00 $775.00
29 611 TYPE 3 STORM MANHOLE EACH 1 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,800.00 $6,800.00 $3,560.00 $3,560.00 $3,640.00 $3,640.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,878.78 $4,878.78 $4,300.00 $4,300.00
30 611 4" SANITARY SEWER LATERAL REPAIR, AS PER PLAN FT. 100 $65.00 $6,500.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $41.00 $4,100.00 $67.00 $6,700.00 $85.00 $8,500.00 $108.83 $10,883.00 $65.00 $6,500.00
31 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,600.00 $6,600.00 $14,385.00 $14,385.00 $7,750.00 $7,750.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,014.63 $10,014.63 $3,700.00 $3,700.00
32 623 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,250.00 $4,250.00 $12,809.00 $12,809.00 $4,150.00 $4,150.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,594.58 $5,594.58 $6,125.00 $6,125.00
33 630 REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN AND REERECTION EACH 1 $250.00 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 $322.00 $322.00 $300.00 $300.00 $250.00 $250.00 $123.28 $123.28 $310.00 $310.00
34 638 8" DIP, CL-52 WATER MAIN, AS PER PLAN FT. 1425 $175.00 $249,375.00 $123.00 $175,275.00 $114.00 $162,450.00 $135.00 $192,375.00 $140.00 $199,500.00 $143.25 $204,131.25 $171.00 $243,675.00
35 638 3/4" TYPE K COPPER WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN FT. 863 $95.00 $81,985.00 $58.00 $50,054.00 $62.00 $53,506.00 $84.00 $72,492.00 $120.00 $103,560.00 $70.19 $60,573.97 $93.00 $80,259.00
36 638 1" TYPE K COPPER WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN FT. 13 $150.00 $1,950.00 $68.00 $884.00 $134.00 $1,742.00 $375.00 $4,875.00 $150.00 $1,950.00 $221.97 $2,885.61 $125.00 $1,625.00
37 638 INTERIOR PRIVATE WATER SERVICE, AS PER PLAN FT. 250 $125.00 $31,250.00 $95.00 $23,750.00 $72.00 $18,000.00 $77.00 $19,250.00 $60.00 $15,000.00 $25.03 $6,257.50 $200.00 $50,000.00
38 638 PRIVATE UNDERGROUND WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN FT. 200 $100.00 $20,000.00 $58.00 $11,600.00 $150.00 $30,000.00 $71.00 $14,200.00 $80.00 $16,000.00 $82.60 $16,520.00 $155.00 $31,000.00
39 638 8" GATE VALVE EACH 4 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,800.00 $11,200.00 $2,995.00 $11,980.00 $2,650.00 $10,600.00 $2,200.00 $8,800.00 $3,398.16 $13,592.64 $3,530.00 $14,120.00
40 638 10"x8" TAPPING SLEEVE AND VALVE EACH 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,317.00 $6,317.00 $7,250.00 $7,250.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,445.36 $7,445.36 $10,415.00 $10,415.00
41 638 6" LINE STOP, AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,780.00 $5,780.00 $7,100.00 $7,100.00 $6,100.00 $6,100.00 $14,135.21 $14,135.21 $10,500.00 $10,500.00
42 638 6-INCH FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY, AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $8,700.00 $8,700.00 $9,769.00 $9,769.00 $8,950.00 $8,950.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,573.02 $11,573.02 $11,330.00 $11,330.00
43 638 VALVE CLOSED AND VALVE BOX FILLED WITH CONCRETE EACH 2 $500.00 $1,000.00 $375.00 $750.00 $530.00 $1,060.00 $295.00 $590.00 $300.00 $600.00 $758.86 $1,517.72 $1,000.00 $2,000.00
44 638 CUT AND PLUG, TYPE 2, AS PER PLAN EACH 2 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,500.00 $11,000.00 $1,102.00 $2,204.00 $1,775.00 $3,550.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00 $4,350.80 $8,701.60 $1,850.00 $3,700.00
45 642 CENTER LINE MILE 0.01 $50,000.00 $500.00 $143,000.00 $1,430.00 $164,722.00 $1,647.22 $129,855.00 $1,298.55 $135,000.00 $1,350.00 $188,800.00 $1,888.00 $5,500.00 $55.00
46 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS 1, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 300 $5.00 $1,500.00 $8.00 $2,400.00 $7.00 $2,100.00 $7.10 $2,130.00 $10.00 $3,000.00 $14.69 $4,407.00 $12.00 $3,600.00
47 861 GEOGRID, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 70 $8.00 $560.00 $19.00 $1,330.00 $15.00 $1,050.00 $10.00 $700.00 $17.00 $1,190.00 $37.04 $2,592.80 $15.00 $1,050.00
48 SPEC ROCK EXCAVATION C.Y. 110 $100.00 $11,000.00 $125.00 $13,750.00 $189.00 $20,790.00 $24.00 $2,640.00 $150.00 $16,500.00 $213.11 $23,442.10 $160.00 $17,600.00
49 SPEC REFLECTIVE CRACKING PAVEMENT INTERLAYER FT. 210 $65.00 $13,650.00 $7.00 $1,470.00 $20.00 $4,200.00 $35.00 $7,350.00 $10.00 $2,100.00 $7.10 $1,491.00 $13.00 $2,730.00

S. 5TH STREET BASE BID TOTAL $606,527.00 $527,960.00 $536,504.22 $525,541.85 $599,639.00 $593,695.00 $676,808.00

S. 5TH STREET ALTERNATE BID
1A 201 CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,521.00 $3,521.00 $22,995.00 $22,995.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,381.48 $2,381.48 No Bid
2A 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $4,055.00 $4,055.00 $9,950.00 $9,950.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $6,175.01 $6,175.01 No Bid
3A 202 BARRIER CURB REMOVED FT. 240 $8.00 $1,920.00 $13.00 $3,120.00 $6.00 $1,440.00 $8.00 $1,920.00 $6.00 $1,440.00 $9.02 $2,164.80 No Bid
4A 202 CURB AND GUTTER REMOVED FT. 22 $12.00 $264.00 $13.00 $286.00 $12.00 $264.00 $11.00 $242.00 $6.00 $132.00 $14.25 $313.50 No Bid
5A 202 WALK REMOVED S.F. 774 $5.00 $3,870.00 $6.50 $5,031.00 $1.00 $774.00 $1.90 $1,470.60 $2.00 $1,548.00 $2.13 $1,648.62 No Bid
6A 202 METER PIT REMOVED EACH 1 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 $308.00 $308.00 $375.00 $375.00 $300.00 $300.00 $629.27 $629.27 No Bid
7A 202 VALVE BOX REMOVED EACH 2 $250.00 $500.00 $300.00 $600.00 $305.00 $610.00 $275.00 $550.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $305.81 $611.62 No Bid
8A 203 EXCAVATION, INCLUDING EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 80 $18.00 $1,440.00 $35.00 $2,800.00 $25.00 $2,000.00 $72.00 $5,760.00 $30.00 $2,400.00 $32.42 $2,593.60 No Bid
9A 204 EXCAVATION OF SUBGRADE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 10 $95.00 $950.00 $40.00 $400.00 $111.00 $1,110.00 $41.00 $410.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $91.92 $919.20 No Bid

10A 204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 237 $6.00 $1,422.00 $2.00 $474.00 $2.00 $474.00 $2.00 $474.00 $1.00 $237.00 $0.73 $173.01 No Bid
11A 254 4" PAVEMENT PLANING, ASPHALT CONCRETE S.Y. 47 $8.00 $376.00 $60.00 $2,820.00 $43.00 $2,021.00 $31.85 $1,496.95 $35.00 $1,645.00 $44.77 $2,104.19 No Bid
12A 304 AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 224 $80.00 $17,920.00 $60.00 $13,440.00 $71.00 $15,904.00 $66.00 $14,784.00 $85.00 $19,040.00 $74.97 $16,793.28 No Bid
13A 407 NON-TRACKING TACK COAT, SURFACE COURSE, APPLIED @ 0.06 GAL./S.Y. GAL. 48 $12.00 $576.00 $12.00 $576.00 $8.00 $384.00 $10.80 $518.40 $7.00 $336.00 $8.68 $416.64 No Bid
14A 411 STABILIZED CRUSHED AGGREGATE C.Y. 7 $85.00 $595.00 $80.00 $560.00 $80.00 $560.00 $90.00 $630.00 $85.00 $595.00 $75.75 $530.25 No Bid
15A 441 ASPHALT CONCRETE INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2, (449) C.Y. 55 $350.00 $19,250.00 $550.00 $30,250.00 $490.00 $26,950.00 $337.00 $18,535.00 $450.00 $24,750.00 $595.65 $32,760.75 No Bid
16A 441 ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, (449), PG64-22 C.Y. 33 $375.00 $12,375.00 $480.00 $15,840.00 $541.00 $17,853.00 $442.00 $14,586.00 $450.00 $14,850.00 $609.91 $20,127.03 No Bid
17A 452 8" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 62 $95.00 $5,890.00 $180.00 $11,160.00 $222.00 $13,764.00 $116.00 $7,192.00 $175.00 $10,850.00 $247.20 $15,326.40 No Bid
18A 608 4" CONCRETE WALK, AS PER PLAN S.F. 635 $12.00 $7,620.00 $15.00 $9,525.00 $20.00 $12,700.00 $9.95 $6,318.25 $15.00 $9,525.00 $22.44 $14,249.40 No Bid
19A 608 CURB RAMP, AS PER PLAN S.F. 38 $20.00 $760.00 $49.00 $1,862.00 103 $3,914.00 $32.00 $1,216.00 $37.00 $1,406.00 $111.00 $4,218.00 No Bid
20A 608 4" CONCRETE WALK FOR PRIVATE UNDERGROUND WATER SERVICE BRANCH 

INSTALLATION, AS PER PLAN S.F. 100 $12.00 $1,200.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 20 $2,000.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $19.00 $1,900.00 $24.40 $2,440.00 No Bid
21A 608 CONCRETE STEPS, TYPE B, FOR PRIVATE UNDERGROUND WATER SERVICE BRANCH 

INSTALLATION, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $50.00 $1,250.00 $290.00 $7,250.00 $247.00 $6,175.00 $166.00 $4,150.00 $305.00 $7,625.00 $262.59 $6,564.75 No Bid
22A 609 TYPE 6 BARRIER CURB, AS PER PLAN FT. 232 $35.00 $8,120.00 $56.00 $12,992.00 $80.00 $18,560.00 $45.00 $10,440.00 $60.00 $13,920.00 $83.74 $19,427.68 No Bid
23A 609 CURB AND GUTTER REPLACED (IN-KIND) FT. 22 $45.00 $990.00 $63.00 $1,386.00 $110.00 $2,420.00 $52.00 $1,144.00 $80.00 $1,760.00 $115.51 $2,541.22 No Bid
24A 610 MODULAR RETAINING WALL FOR PRIVATE UNDERGROUND WATER SERVICE BRANCH 

INSTALLATION, AS PER PLAN S.F. 20 $55.00 $1,100.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 $243.00 $4,860.00 $72.00 $1,440.00 $350.00 $7,000.00 $123.45 $2,469.00 No Bid
25A 611 4" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $40.00 $1,000.00 $15.00 $375.00 $1.00 $25.00 $25.00 $625.00 $25.00 $625.00 $26.63 $665.75 No Bid
26A 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $50.00 $1,250.00 $18.00 $450.00 $1.00 $25.00 $26.00 $650.00 $30.00 $750.00 $33.42 $835.50 No Bid
27A 611 8" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $60.00 $1,500.00 $26.00 $650.00 $1.00 $25.00 $27.00 $675.00 $36.00 $900.00 $42.50 $1,062.50 No Bid
28A 611 TYPE 3 STORM MANHOLE EACH 1 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $6,800.00 $6,800.00 $3,560.00 $3,560.00 $3,640.00 $3,640.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,972.94 $4,972.94 No Bid
29A 611 4" SANITARY SEWER LATERAL REPAIR, AS PER PLAN FT. 100 $65.00 $6,500.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $41.00 $4,100.00 $67.00 $6,700.00 $85.00 $8,500.00 $110.93 $11,093.00 No Bid
30A 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,600.00 $6,600.00 $14,385.00 $14,385.00 $7,750.00 $7,750.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $9,845.42 $9,845.42 No Bid
31A 623 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,250.00 $4,250.00 $12,809.00 $12,809.00 $4,150.00 $4,150.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,702.55 $5,702.55 No Bid
32A 630 REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN AND REERECTION EACH 1 $250.00 $250.00 $150.00 $150.00 $322.00 $322.00 $300.00 $300.00 $250.00 $250.00 $125.66 $125.66 No Bid
33A 638 8" DIP, CL-52 WATER MAIN, AS PER PLAN FT. 1425 $175.00 $249,375.00 $123.00 $175,275.00 $114.00 $162,450.00 $135.00 $192,375.00 $140.00 $199,500.00 $146.01 $208,064.25 No Bid
34A 638 3/4" TYPE K COPPER WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN FT. 142 $95.00 $13,490.00 $58.00 $8,236.00 $62.00 $8,804.00 $84.00 $11,928.00 $120.00 $17,040.00 $97.37 $13,826.54 No Bid
35A 638 WATER SERVICE BRANCH, BY DIRECTIONAL DRILL, AS PER PLAN FT. 735 $125.00 $91,875.00 $65.00 $47,775.00 $74.00 $54,390.00 $112.00 $82,320.00 $100.00 $73,500.00 $76.07 $55,911.45 No Bid
36A 638 1" TYPE K COPPER WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN FT. 13 $150.00 $1,950.00 $68.00 $884.00 $134.00 $1,742.00 $375.00 $4,875.00 $150.00 $1,950.00 $226.25 $2,941.25 No Bid
37A 638 INTERIOR PRIVATE WATER SERVICE, AS PER PLAN FT. 250 $125.00 $31,250.00 $95.00 $23,750.00 $72.00 $18,000.00 $77.00 $19,250.00 $60.00 $15,000.00 $25.52 $6,380.00 No Bid
38A 638 PRIVATE UNDERGROUND WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN FT. 200 $100.00 $20,000.00 $58.00 $11,600.00 $150.00 $30,000.00 $71.00 $14,200.00 $80.00 $16,000.00 $84.20 $16,840.00 No Bid
39A 638 8" GATE VALVE EACH 4 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,800.00 $11,200.00 $2,995.00 $11,980.00 $2,650.00 $10,600.00 $2,200.00 $8,800.00 $3,463.74 $13,854.96 No Bid
40A 638 10"x8" TAPPING SLEEVE AND VALVE EACH 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,317.00 $6,317.00 $7,250.00 $7,250.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,589.05 $7,589.05 No Bid
41A 638 6" LINE STOP, AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,780.00 $5,780.00 $7,100.00 $7,100.00 $6,100.00 $6,100.00 $14,408.01 $14,408.01 No Bid
42A 638 6-INCH FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY, AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $8,700.00 $8,700.00 $9,769.00 $9,769.00 $8,950.00 $8,950.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $11,796.38 $11,796.38 No Bid
43A 638 VALVE CLOSED AND VALVE BOX FILLED WITH CONCRETE EACH 2 $500.00 $1,000.00 $375.00 $750.00 $530.00 $1,060.00 $295.00 $590.00 $300.00 $600.00 $773.51 $1,547.02 No Bid
44A 638 CUT AND PLUG, TYPE 2, AS PER PLAN EACH 2 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,500.00 $11,000.00 $1,102.00 $2,204.00 $1,775.00 $3,550.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00 $4,434.77 $8,869.54 No Bid
45A 642 CENTER LINE MILE 0.01 $50,000.00 $500.00 $143,000.00 $1,430.00 $164,722.00 $1,647.22 $129,855.00 $1,298.55 $135,000.00 $1,350.00 $192,443.00 $1,924.43 No Bid
46A 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS 1, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 300 $5.00 $1,500.00 $8.00 $2,400.00 $7.00 $2,100.00 $7.10 $2,130.00 $10.00 $3,000.00 $11.58 $3,474.00 No Bid
47A 861 GEOGRID, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 70 $8.00 $560.00 $19.00 $1,330.00 $15.00 $1,050.00 $10.00 $700.00 $17.00 $1,190.00 $37.75 $2,642.50 No Bid
48A SPEC ROCK EXCAVATION C.Y. 110 $100.00 $11,000.00 $125.00 $13,750.00 $189.00 $20,790.00 $24.00 $2,640.00 $150.00 $16,500.00 $217.23 $23,895.30 No Bid
49A SPEC REFLECTIVE CRACKING PAVEMENT INTERLAYER FT. 210 $65.00 $13,650.00 $7.00 $1,470.00 $20.00 $4,200.00 $35.00 $7,350.00 $10.00 $2,100.00 $7.23 $1,518.30 No Bid

S. 5TH STREET ALTERNATE BID TOTAL $611,538.00 $510,697.00 $520,155.22 $529,693.75 $568,514.00 $587,365.00 No Bid

E. MAIN STREET BASE BID
50 201 CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $14,450.00 $14,450.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $208.66 $208.66 $600.00 $600.00
51 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $17,250.00 $17,250.00 $13,150.00 $13,150.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $3,663.93 $3,663.93 $1,225.00 $1,225.00
52 304 AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 40 $150.00 $6,000.00 $50.00 $2,000.00 $79.00 $3,160.00 $88.00 $3,520.00 $80.00 $3,200.00 $103.26 $4,130.40 $86.00 $3,440.00
53 407 NON-TRACKING TACK COAT, SURFACE COURSE, APPLIED @ 0.06 GAL./S.Y. GAL. 1 $15.00 $15.00 $12.00 $12.00 $30.00 $30.00 $216.00 $216.00 $25.00 $25.00 $41.74 $41.74 $31.00 $31.00
54 441 ASPHALT CONCRETE INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2, (449) C.Y. 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $550.00 $550.00 $750.00 $750.00 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 $600.00 $600.00 $1,088.46 $1,088.46 $920.00 $920.00
55 441 ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, (449), PG64-22 C.Y. 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $480.00 $480.00 $750.00 $750.00 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 $600.00 $600.00 $1,088.46 $1,088.46 $920.00 $920.00
56 611 4" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $40.00 $1,000.00 $15.00 $375.00 $1.00 $25.00 $25.00 $625.00 $20.00 $500.00 $38.88 $972.00 $20.00 $500.00
57 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $50.00 $1,250.00 $18.00 $450.00 $1.00 $25.00 $26.00 $650.00 $25.00 $625.00 $48.69 $1,217.25 $25.00 $625.00
58 611 8" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 25 $60.00 $1,500.00 $26.00 $650.00 $1.00 $25.00 $27.00 $675.00 $30.00 $750.00 $61.81 $1,545.25 $31.00 $775.00
59 613 CONTROLLED DENSITY FILL C.Y. 10 $400.00 $4,000.00 $200.00 $2,000.00 $321.00 $3,210.00 $152.00 $1,520.00 $220.00 $2,200.00 $355.67 $3,556.70 $430.00 $4,300.00
60 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $27,341.00 $27,341.00 $29,950.00 $29,950.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,399.67 $7,399.67 $15,300.00 $15,300.00
61 623 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $9,750.00 $9,750.00 $2,850.00 $2,850.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,921.18 $2,921.18 $2,450.00 $2,450.00
62 630 REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN AND REERECTION EACH 2 $250.00 $500.00 $150.00 $300.00 $352.00 $704.00 $300.00 $600.00 $400.00 $800.00 $182.28 $364.56 $450.00 $900.00
63 638 10" DIP, CL-52 WATER MAIN, AS PER PLAN FT. 542 $300.00 $162,600.00 $158.00 $85,636.00 $141.00 $76,422.00 $168.00 $91,056.00 $180.00 $97,560.00 $224.90 $121,895.80 $190.00 $102,980.00
64 638 6-INCH FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY, AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $10,369.00 $10,369.00 $9,785.00 $9,785.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $16,448.15 $16,448.15 $11,330.00 $11,330.00
65 642 EDGE LINE, 4" FT. 5 $250.00 $1,250.00 $138.00 $690.00 $170.00 $850.00 $130.00 $650.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $208.66 $1,043.30 $100.00 $500.00
66 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS 1, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 560 $8.00 $4,480.00 $8.00 $4,480.00 $5.00 $2,800.00 $7.10 $3,976.00 $10.00 $5,600.00 $8.70 $4,872.00 $12.00 $6,720.00
67 SPEC REMOVE AND REPLACE LANDSCAPE STONE, IN KIND S.Y. 5 $200.00 $1,000.00 $275.00 $1,375.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $125.00 $625.00 $150.00 $750.00 $37.27 $186.35 $125.00 $625.00
68 SPEC REMOVE AND RESET BOULDERS EACH 9 $750.00 $6,750.00 $150.00 $1,350.00 $263.00 $2,367.00 $75.00 $675.00 $100.00 $900.00 $638.46 $5,746.14 $300.00 $2,700.00

E. MAIN STREET BASE BID TOTAL $227,345.00 $132,448.00 $160,328.00 $177,873.00 $144,110.00 $178,390.00 $156,841.00

S. 5TH STREET BASE BID + E. MAIN STREET BASE BID TOTAL $833,872.00 $660,408.00 $696,832.22 $703,414.85 $743,749.00 $772,085.00 $833,649.00

S. 5TH STREET ALTERNATE BID + E. MAIN STREET BASE BID TOTAL $838,883.00 $643,145.00 $680,483.22 $707,566.75 $712,624.00 $765,755.00 No Bid
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