
  
REF. ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

CONTRACT A
1 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,200.00 $7,200.00 $2,012.50 $2,012.50 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
2 624 MOBILIZATION LUMP 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,750.00 $5,750.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00
3 SPEC SANITARY MANHOLE PROTECTIVE LINING SYSTEM VT. FT. 102 $275.00 $28,050.00 $265.00 $27,030.00 $310.50 $31,671.00 $358.02 $36,518.04 $350.00 $35,700.00
4 SPEC SANITARY SEWER BYPASS PUMPING LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1,725.00 $1,725.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $5,200.00 $5,200.00

SUBTOTAL $49,050.00 $36,731.00 $41,158.50 No Bid No Bid $40,018.04 $49,900.00

CONTRACT B
1 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,325.00 $6,325.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
2 624 MOBILIZATION LUMP 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,135.10 $2,135.10 $5,150.00 $5,150.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
3 SPEC SLIP-LINING OF 8" SANITARY SEWER FT. 3304 $60.00 $198,240.00 $40.60 $134,142.40 $35.00 $115,640.00 $35.00 $115,640.00
4 SPEC SLIP-LINING OF 15" SANITARY SEWER FT. 1961 $90.00 $176,490.00 $69.80 $136,877.80 $73.00 $143,153.00 $86.00 $168,646.00
5 SPEC SANITARY SEWER PIPE CLEAN AND TELEVISE FT. 5265 $3.00 $15,795.00 $6.25 $32,906.25 $11.00 $57,915.00 $16.00 $84,240.00
6 SPEC SANITARY SEWER BYPASS PUMPING LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,270.20 $4,270.20 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,100.00 $1,100.00

SUBTOTAL $411,525.00 No Bid $316,656.75 $327,858.00 $392,626.00 No Bid No Bid

TOTAL $460,575.00 $357,815.25
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