
  
REF. ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

1 201 CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $12,575.00 $12,575.00
2 203 EXCAVATION, INCLUDING EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 2091 $28.00 $58,548.00 $25.00 $52,275.00 $39.00 $81,549.00 $35.00 $73,185.00 $12.81 $26,785.71 *1
3 204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION S.Y. 3215 $2.00 $6,430.00 $0.50 $1,607.50 $1.00 $3,215.00 $5.00 $16,075.00 $1.66 $5,336.90 *2
4 304 6" AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 536 $80.00 $42,880.00 $75.00 $40,200.00 $66.00 $35,376.00 $90.00 $48,240.00 $36.19 $19,397.84 *3
5 VT 1-1/4" ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, PG58-28 C.Y. 111 $425.00 $47,175.00 $300.00 $33,300.00 $295.00 $32,745.00 $375.00 $41,625.00 No Bid No Bid
6 407 NON-TRACKING TACK COAT, 0.06 GAL/S.Y. GAL. 192 $9.00 $1,728.00 $8.00 $1,536.00 $7.00 $1,344.00 $10.00 $1,920.00 No Bid No Bid
7 441 1-3/4" ASPHALT CONCRETE INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 1, (449), PG58-28 C.Y. 155 $300.00 $46,500.00 $300.00 $46,500.00 $295.00 $45,725.00 $375.00 $58,125.00 No Bid No Bid
8 605 4" BASE PIPE UNDERDRAIN, 707.31, AS PER PLAN FT. 409 $20.00 $8,180.00 $25.00 $10,225.00 $29.00 $11,861.00 $35.00 $14,315.00 $29.89 $12,225.01 *4
9 605 4" BASE PIPE UNDERDRAIN, 707.41, AS PER PLAN FT. 10 $20.00 $200.00 $25.00 $250.00 $29.00 $290.00 $40.00 $400.00 $29.89 $298.90 *5

10 607 FENCE, 4' CHAIN LINK, AS PER PLAN FT. 636 $105.00 $66,780.00 $55.00 $34,980.00 $87.00 $55,332.00 $35.00 $22,260.00 No Bid No Bid
11 607 FENCE, 10' CHAIN LINK, AS PER PLAN FT. 800 $105.00 $84,000.00 $90.00 $72,000.00 $131.00 $104,800.00 $95.00 $76,000.00 No Bid No Bid
12 607 GATE, TYPE CL (4') EACH 7 $200.00 $1,400.00 $1,200.00 $8,400.00 $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $1,500.00 $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid
13 611 4" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR, AS PER PLAN FT. 15 $20.00 $300.00 $50.00 $750.00 $30.00 $450.00 $40.00 $600.00 $135.90 $2,038.50
14 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR, AS PER PLAN FT. 15 $22.00 $330.00 $50.00 $750.00 $30.00 $450.00 $45.00 $675.00 $185.00 $2,775.00
15 611 8" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR, AS PER PLAN FT. 15 $25.00 $375.00 $50.00 $750.00 $30.00 $450.00 $50.00 $750.00 $133.78 $2,006.70
16 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS 1, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 1250 $2.00 $2,500.00 $2.00 $2,500.00 $5.00 $6,250.00 $3.50 $4,375.00 No Bid No Bid
17 661 CLADASTRIS KENTUKEA EACH 5 $750.00 $3,750.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $800.00 $4,000.00 $750.00 $3,750.00 No Bid No Bid
18 661 METASEQUOIA GLYPTOSTROBOIDES EACH 3 $750.00 $2,250.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $850.00 $2,550.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 No Bid No Bid
19 661 ACER SACCHARUM 'GREEN MOUNTAIN' EACH 4 $750.00 $3,000.00 $1,200.00 $4,800.00 $800.00 $3,200.00 $750.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid
20 661 JUNIPERUS CH. 'SEA GREEN' EACH 18 $100.00 $1,800.00 $100.00 $1,800.00 $200.00 $3,600.00 $130.00 $2,340.00 No Bid No Bid
21 661 CORNUS ALBA EACH 8 $100.00 $800.00 $100.00 $800.00 $300.00 $2,400.00 $100.00 $800.00 No Bid No Bid
22 661 CALAMAGROSTIS ACUTIFLORA EACH 44 $50.00 $2,200.00 $100.00 $4,400.00 $75.00 $3,300.00 $75.00 $3,300.00 No Bid No Bid
23 SPEC. PICKLEBALL COURT ASSEMBLY INSTALLATION EACH 6 $3,600.00 $21,600.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $3,700.00 $22,200.00 No Bid No Bid
24 SPEC. MULTI-USE COURT ASSEMBLY INSTALLATION EACH 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,800.00 $3,800.00 No Bid No Bid
25 SPEC. COURT SURFACE AND COURT STRIPING LUMP 1 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $41,000.00 $41,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 No Bid No Bid

BASE BID TOTAL $476,726.00 $414,423.50 $463,387.00 $512,535.00 $86,483.90 *7

ALTERNATE #1
26 SPEC. WINDSCREEN FT. 664 $10.00 $6,640.00 $10.00 $6,640.00 $29.00 $19,256.00 $25.00 $16,600.00 No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE #1 TOTAL $6,640.00 $6,640.00 $19,256.00 $16,600.00 No Bid

BASE + ALTERNATE TOTAL $483,366.00 $421,063.50 $482,643.00 $529,135.00 No Bid

*1 Total given was $26,800.00
*2 Total given was $5,360.00
*3 Total given was $19,400.00

 *4 Total given was $12,228.40
 *5 Total given was $299.80
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