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No.

202
202
202
202

254
301
304
407
441
441
608
609
611
611
611
611
611
611
614
623
630
630
638
638
638
638
638
638
638
638
638
638
638
638
638
638
659

638

638
638

DESCRIPTION

BASE BID

REMOVED, AS PER PLAN

CURB AND GUTTER REMOVED

WALK REMOVED

VALVE BOX REMOVED

FULL DEPTH PAVEMENT REPAIR, AS PER PLAN
2" PAVEMENT PLANING, ASPHALT CONCRETE
ASPHALT CONCRETE BASE, PG 64-22
AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN
NON-TRACKING TACK COAT

2" ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, PG 64-22 (449)

1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, PG 64-22 (449) (ASPHALT OVERLAY)

4" CONCRETE WALK

CURB AND GUTTER REPLACED (IN-KIND)

4" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN

6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN

8" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, AS PER PLAN

12" CONDUIT, TYPE B, STORM REPAIR

4" SANITARY LATERAL REPAIR, AS PER PLAN

MANHOLE ADJUSTED TO GRADE

MAINTAINING TRAFFIC

CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING, AS PER PLAN
REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN AND REERECTION
REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED POST SUPPORT AND REERECTION
4" INSERTION VALVE, AS PER PLAN

4" GATE VALVE

6" GATE VALVE

10" GATE VALVE

12" X 12" TAPPING SLEEVE AND VALVE

3/4" TYPE K COPPER WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN
1" TYPE K COPPER WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN
4" PVC AWWA C-900 DR-18 WATER MAIN, AS PER PLAN

6" PVC AWWA C-900 DR-18 WATER MAIN, AS PER PLAN

10" PVC AWWA C-900 DR-18 WATER MAIN, AS PER PLAN
12" PVC AWWA C-900 DR-18 WATER MAIN, AS PER PLAN

6" FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY, AS PER PLAN

VALVE BOX ADJUSTED TO GRADE

FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY REMOVED

SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS 1, AS PER PLAN

BASE BID TOTAL

Alternate #1: Replace Existing Water Meter Pits Throughout the Project Route

METER PIT, INCLUDING METER, SETTING, AND VALVES, AS PER PLAN
TOTAL ALTERNATE #1

UNIT OF

MEASURE

LUmP
FT.
S.F.
EACH
S.y.
S.Y.
cy.
cy.
GAL.
cy.
cy.
S.F.
FT.
FT.
FT.
FT.
FT.
FT.
EACH
LUMP
LUmP
EACH
EACH
EACH
EACH
EACH
EACH
EACH
FT.
FT.
FT.
FT.
FT.
FT.
EACH
EACH
EACH
S.Y.

EACH

Village of Blanchester
East Fancy Street Water Main Replacement REBID

APPROX. UNIT
ary. cosT
1 $5,000.00
60 $6.00
30 $2.00
3 $200.00
300 $100.00
1620 $6.00
187 $225.00
9 $130.00
535 $6.00
84 $245.00
196 $245.00
30 $10.00
60 $30.00
50 $15.00
50 $15.00
50 $15.00
20 $80.00
50 $40.00
8 $500.00
1 $6,000.00

1 $3,000.00

1 $100.00

1 $100.00

1 $7,000.00

1 $1,200.00

3 $1,300.00

7 $3,000.00

1 $9,000.00
572 $60.00
33 $60.00
12 $120.00
136 $100.00
1905 $110.00
187 $120.00
5 $7,500.00

2 $250.00

2 $500.00
2500 $3.00
22 $1,000.00

Alternate #2: Replace Type K Copper Water Services with HDPE CTS Plastic DR-9 Water Services (Replaces Ref. No. 29 and 30)

3/4" HDPE CTS PLASTIC DR-9 WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN
1" HDPE CTS PLASTIC DR-9 WATER SERVICE BRANCH, AS PER PLAN
TOTAL ALTERNATE #2

BASE + ALTERNATE #2

FT.
FT.

572 $60.00
33 $60.00

February 24, 2023

JTM Smith Construction, Inc.

Fayetteville, OH

TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
cost cosT cost
$5,000.00 $100.00 $100.00
$360.00 $10.00 $600.00
$60.00 $10.00 $300.00
$600.00 $100.00 $300.00
$30,000.00 $101.65 $30,495.00
$9,720.00 $4.73 $7,662.60
$42,075.00 $200.00 $37,400.00
$1,170.00 $200.00 $1,800.00
$3,210.00 $7.00 $3,745.00
$20,580.00 $275.00 $23,100.00
$48,020.00 $275.00 $53,900.00
$300.00 $30.00 $900.00
$1,800.00 $40.00 $2,400.00
$750.00 $6.00 $300.00
$750.00 $6.00 $300.00
$750.00 $6.00 $300.00
$1,600.00 $80.00 $1,600.00
$2,000.00 $30.00 $1,500.00
$4,000.00 $300.00 $2,400.00
$6,000.00 | $5,000.00 $5,000.00
$3,000.00 | $2,500.00 $2,500.00
$100.00 $50.00 $50.00
$100.00 $50.00 $50.00
$7,000.00 | $7,000.00 $7,000.00
$1,200.00 | $1,400.00 $1,400.00
$3,900.00 | $1,000.00 $3,000.00
$21,000.00 | $2,500.00 $17,500.00
$9,000.00 | $9,000.00 $9,000.00
$34,320.00 $60.00 $34,320.00
$1,980.00 $80.00 $2,640.00
$1,440.00 $200.00 $2,400.00
$13,600.00 $110.00 $14,960.00
$209,550.00 $120.00 $228,600.00
$22,440.00 $150.00 $28,050.00
$37,500.00 | $6,500.00 $32,500.00
$500.00 $200.00 $400.00
$1,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00
$7,500.00 $2.00 $5,000.00
$553,875.00 $564,472.60
$22,000.00 | $1,200.00 $26,400.00
$22,000.00 $26,400.00
$34,320.00 $50.00 $28,600.00
$1,980.00 $60.00 $1,980.00
$36,300.00 $30,580.00
$553,875.00 $558,092.60

Panetta Excavating, Inc.

UNIT
COST

$500.00
$10.00
$30.00
$100.00
$150.00
$5.00
$220.00
$100.00
$10.00
$220.00
$210.00
$100.00
$100.00
$10.00
$10.00
$50.00
$100.00
$20.00
$500.00
$15,000.00
$15,000.00
$1,000.00
$1,000.00
$9,500.00
$2,000.00
$3,000.00
$4,000.00
$8,000.00
$65.00
$75.00
$100.00
$100.00
$105.00
$150.00
$7,500.00
$500.00
$500.00
$3.00

$900.00

$20.00
$30.00

KT Holden Construction LLC

Blanchester, OH Lebanon, OH
TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
COsT cosT COsT
$500.00 $100.00 $100.00
$600.00 $10.00 $600.00
$900.00 $10.00 $300.00
$300.00 $10.00 $30.00
$45,000.00 $65.00 $19,500.00
$8,100.00 $7.15 $11,583.00
$41,140.00 $255.00 $47,685.00
$900.00 $230.00 $2,070.00
$5,350.00 $4.10 $2,193.50
$18,480.00 $250.00 $21,000.00
$41,160.00 $216.10 $42,355.60
$3,000.00 $20.00 $600.00
$6,000.00 $65.00 $3,900.00
$500.00 $10.00 $500.00
$500.00 $15.00 $750.00
$2,500.00 $20.00 $1,000.00
$2,000.00 $25.00 $500.00
$1,000.00 $20.00 $1,000.00
$4,000.00 $850.00 $6,800.00
$15,000.00| $6,000.00 $6,000.00
$15,000.00( $2,500.00 $2,500.00
$1,000.00 $10.00 $10.00
$1,000.00 $10.00 $10.00
$9,500.00( $9,625.00 $9,625.00
$2,000.00 $950.00 $950.00
$9,000.00| $1,100.00 $3,300.00
$28,000.00( $2,730.00 $19,110.00
$8,000.00| $12,300.00 $12,300.00
$37,180.00 $102.00 $58,344.00
$2,475.00 $115.00 $3,795.00
$1,200.00 $435.00 $5,220.00
$13,600.00 $196.00 $26,656.00
$200,025.00 $120.00 $228,600.00
$28,050.00 $181.00 $33,847.00
$37,500.00( $5,725.00 $28,625.00
$1,000.00 $25.00 $50.00
$1,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00
$7,500.00 $1.00 $2,500.00
$599,960.00 $604,909.10
$19,800.00( $1,250.00 $27,500.00
$19,800.00 $27,500.00
$11,440.00 No Bid No Bid
$990.00 No Bid No Bid
$12,430.00 No Bid
$572,735.00 No Bid

Stauffer Site Services LLC

UNIT
COST

$7,500.00
$10.00
$5.00
$250.00
$56.00
$8.00
$250.00
$65.00
$6.00
$260.00
$225.00
$25.00
$45.00
$5.00
$10.00
$20.00
$50.00
$40.00
$500.00
$15,000.00
$3,500.00
$300.00
$300.00
$10,000.00
$1,750.00
$2,500.00
$4,000.00
$10,000.00
$110.00
$140.00
$100.00
$125.00
$125.00
$140.00
$10,000.00
$350.00
$700.00
$3.50

$1,250.00

$75.00
$100.00

Morrow, OH

TOTAL
CosT

$7,500.00
$600.00
$150.00
$750.00
$16,800.00
$12,960.00
$46,750.00
$585.00
$3,210.00
$21,840.00
$44,100.00
$750.00
$2,700.00
$250.00
$500.00
$1,000.00
$1,000.00
$2,000.00
$4,000.00
$15,000.00
$3,500.00
$300.00
$300.00
$10,000.00
$1,750.00
$7,500.00
$28,000.00
$10,000.00
$62,920.00
$4,620.00
$1,200.00
$17,000.00
$238,125.00
$26,180.00
$50,000.00
$700.00
$1,400.00
$8,750.00
$65 0

$27,500.00
$27,500.00

$42,900.00
$3,300.00

$46,200.00

$633,350.00
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