N

O n e City of Van Wert

Eggerss Stadium Sewer Replacement
December 1, 2022

REF. ITEM UNITOF APPROX. UNIT
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE  QTY. cosT
1 201 CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $7,500.00
2 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $5,000.00
3 202 SANITARY MANHOLE REMOVED EACH 3 $2,000.00
4 202 PIPE REMOVED, 24" AND UNDER FT. 75 $25.00
5 204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION SY. 43 $5.00
6 302 5" ASPHALT CONCRETE BASE, PG64-22 cy. 6 $500.00
7 304 AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN C.. 219 $55.00
8 407 NON-TRACKING TACK COAT, 0.06 GAL/S.Y. GAL 3 $100.00
9 441 1-1/4" ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, PG 64-22, (449) C.. 2 $750.00
10 607 TYPE CL FENCE REMOVED AND REBUILT FT. 70 $100.00
11 608 4" CONCRETE WALK SF 145 $25.00
12 609 COMBINATION CURB AND GUTTER REPLACED, IN KIND FT. 15 $75.00
13 611 4" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 50 $20.00
14 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 50 $25.00
15 611 8" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 50 $30.00
16 611 12" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45 FT. 5 $40.00
17 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.33 FT. 8 $25.00
18 611 TYPE 2-2B CATCH BASIN EACH 1 $4,000.00
19 611 STORM SEWER MANHOLE, NO. 3, AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $6,500.00
20 611 6" PVC SDR-26 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 5 $90.00
21 611 6" SANITARY SEWER LATERAL, PVC SDR-26, AS PER PLAN FT. 46 $100.00
22 611 8" PVC SDR-26 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 53 $95.00
23 611 10" PVC SDR-26 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 363 $105.00
24 611 15" PVC SDR-26 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 61 $125.00
25 611 24" PVC PS 115 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 10 $200.00
26 611 30" PVCPS 115 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 699 $250.00
27 611 48" PVC PS 115 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 8 $400.00
28 611 TYPE 3 SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE (84" DIA.), AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $9,000.00
29 611 TYPE 3 SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN EACH 9 $6,500.00
30 611 TYPE D SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE EACH 1 $7,000.00
31 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $7,500.00
32 630 REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN AND REERECTION EACH 3 $250.00
33 642 PAVEMENT MARKING MISCELLANEOUS REPAIR, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $250.00
34 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS 1, AS PER PLAN S.. 600 $6.00
35 SPEC. FILL AND PLUG EXISTNG CONDUIT FT. 598 $80.00
36 SPEC. SANITARY MANHOLE WITH WEIR WALL (72" BASE) EACH 1 $10,000.00
37 SPEC. CONCRETE PIPE SUPPORT EACH 1 $250.00
CONSTRUCTION TOTAL
ALTERNATE #1: REPLACE 24", 30", AND 48" PS 115 SANITARY SEWER WITH ADS SANITITE HP SANITARY SEWER
25A 611 24" ADS SANITITE HP SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 10 $225.00
26A 611 30" ADS SANITITE HP SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 699 $250.00
27A 611 48" ADS SANITITE HP SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 8 $500.00
ALTERNATE #1 TOTAL
TOTAL WITH ALTERNATE #1

TOTAL

CosT
$7,500.00
$5,000.00
$6,000.00
$1,875.00
$215.00
$3,000.00
$12,045.00
$300.00
$1,500.00
$7,000.00
$3,625.00
$1,125.00
$1,000.00
$1,250.00
$1,500.00
$200.00
$200.00
$4,000.00
$6,500.00
$450.00
$4,600.00
$5,035.00
$38,115.00
$7,625.00
$2,000.00
$174,750.00
$3,200.00
$9,000.00
$58,500.00
$7,000.00
$7,500.00
$750.00
$250.00
$3,600.00
$47,840.00
$10,000.00
$250.00

$444,300.00

$2,250.00
$174,750.00
$4,000.00

$181,000.00

$445,350.00

UNIT
CosT
$8,050.00
$1,260.00
$260.00
$6.41
$2.25
$576.00
$44.50
$6.75
$540.00
$67.50
$15.00
$162.25
$9.45
$16.00
$24.50
$59.50
$109.00
$3,463.00
$4,679.00
$118.50
$225.00
$73.25
$111.00
$178.87
$398.50
$425.25
$1,169.00
$22,621.00
$8,029.00
$7,991.00
$58,191.00
$273.00
$1,350.00
$13.00
$115.00
$12,707.00
$2,708.00

$337.50
$383.50
$897.50

VTF Excavation
Celina, Ohio

TOTAL
CosT
$8,050.00
$1,260.00
$780.00
$480.75
$96.75
$3,456.00
$9,745.50
$20.25
$1,080.00
$4,725.00
$2,175.00
$2,433.75
$472.50
$800.00
$1,225.00
$297.50
$872.00
$3,463.00
$4,679.00
$592.50
$10,350.00
$3,882.25
$40,293.00
$10,911.07
$3,985.00
$297,249.75
$9,352.00
$22,621.00
$72,261.00
$7,991.00
$58,191.00
$819.00
$1,350.00
$7,800.00
$68,770.00
$12,707.00
$2,708.00

$677,945.57

$3,375.00
$268,066.50
$7,180.00

$278,621.50

$645,980.32

Fenson Contracting, LLC

UNIT
cosT
$10,000.00
$15,000.00
$750.00
$5.00
$3.00
$775.00
$30.00
$10.00
$1,000.00
$175.00
$20.00
$70.00
$12.50
$19.00
$28.00
$180.00
$95.00
$2,500.00
$3,500.00
$150.00
$250.00
$125.00
$125.00
$175.00
$400.00
$425.00
$2,500.00
$30,000.00
$12,000.00
$12,000.00
$5,000.00
$75.00
$2,000.00
$4.00
$75.00
$13,500.00
$2,500.00

-$70.00
-$50.00
-$500.00

Fort Jennings, Ohio

TOTAL
CosT
$10,000.00
$15,000.00
$2,250.00
$375.00
$129.00
$4,650.00
$6,570.00
$30.00
$2,000.00
$12,250.00
$2,900.00
$1,050.00
$625.00
$950.00
$1,400.00
$900.00
$760.00
$2,500.00
$3,500.00
$750.00
$11,500.00
$6,625.00
$45,375.00
$10,675.00
$4,000.00
$297,075.00
$20,000.00
$30,000.00
$108,000.00
$12,000.00
$5,000.00
$225.00
$2,000.00
$2,400.00
$44,850.00
$13,500.00
$2,500.00

$684,314.00

-$700.00
-$34,950.00
-$4,000.00

($39,650.00)

$323,589.00

Sturm Construction Inc.

UNIT
CosT
$2,954.00
$5,000.00
$2,000.00
$20.00
$1.00
$400.00
$70.00
$10.00
$500.00
$50.00
$50.00
$70.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1,800.00
$3,500.00
$150.00
$100.00
$100.00
$120.00
$300.00
$400.00
$550.00
$2,000.00
$28,000.00
$8,000.00
$5,000.00
$4,500.00
$300.00
$1,000.00
$4.00
$140.00
$20,000.00
$4,000.00

Sidney, Ohio

TOTAL
CosT
$2,954.00
$5,000.00
$6,000.00
$1,500.00
$43.00
$2,400.00
$15,330.00
$30.00
$1,000.00
$3,500.00
$7,250.00
$1,050.00
$50.00
$50.00
$50.00
$5.00
$8.00
$1,800.00
$3,500.00
$750.00
$4,600.00
$5,300.00
$43,560.00
$18,300.00
$4,000.00
$384,450.00
$16,000.00
$28,000.00
$72,000.00
$5,000.00
$4,500.00
$900.00
$1,000.00
$2,400.00
$83,720.00
$20,000.00
$4,000.00

$750,000.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
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