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DESCRIPTION

CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN

REMOVED, AS PER PLAN

WALK REMOVED

ASPHALT PAVEMENT REMOVED

EXCAVATION AND EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN

SUBGRADE COMPACTION AND PROOF ROLLING, AS PER PLAN (PARKING LOT AND DRIVE)

SUBGRADE COMPACTION AND PROOF ROLLING, AS PER PLAN (ASPHALT TRAIL)
EXCAVATION OF SUBGRADE AND STRUCTURAL EMBANKMENT, AS PER PLAN
AGGREGATE BASE, LIMESTONE, AS PER PLAN (PARKING LOT AND DRIVE)
AGGREGATE BASE, LIMESTONE, AS PER PLAN (ASPHALT TRAIL)
NON-TRACKING TACK COAT, 0.06 GAL/S.Y.

STABILIZED CRUSHED AGGREGATE (CONCRETE WALK AND CURB RAMPS)
STABILIZED CRUSHED AGGREGATE (ASPHALT TRAIL)

ASPHALT CONCRETE INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2, (449)

ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1,(449) PG 64-22 (PARKING LOT)
ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1,(449) PG 64-22 (ASPHALT TRAIL)
7" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, AS PER PLAN

TYPE C ROCK CHANNEL PROTECTION

CONCRETE MASONRY

4" CONCRETE WALK

4" STAMPED CONCRETE WALK, AS PER PLAN

CURB RAMP, AS PER PLAN

TYPE 6 BARRIER CURB, AS PER PLAN

12" STORM SEWER, AS PER PLAN

YARD DRAIN, AS PER PLAN

TYPE 1A CATCH BASIN

TYPE 2-2B CATCH BASIN

MAINTAINING TRAFFIC

CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING, AS PER PLAN

GROUND MOUNTED SUPPORT, NO. 3 POST

SIGN, FLAT SHEET

CROSSWALK LINE, 12", TYPE 1

TRANSVERSE/DIAGONAL LINE, TYPE 1

PARKING LOT STALL MARKING

HANDICAP SYMBOL MARKING

TOPSOIL FURNISHED AND PLACED

SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS 1, AS PER PLAN

EROSION CONTROL

STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN

BRICK PAVING, WALK

LANDSCAPING

BASE BID TOTAL

ALTERNATE BIID #1 - BARN DEMOLITION, RESTORATION, AND PATIO AREA
EXCAVATION AND EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN
STABILIZED CRUSHED AGGREGATE

4" CONCRETE WALK

BARN DEMOLITION AND RESTORATION

TOTAL

BASE + ALTERNATE #1 TOTAL

Bid Tabulation

Centerville-Washington Park District
Grant Park McEwen Road Entrance

UNIT OF  APPROX.
MEASURE  QTY.
LUmP 1
LUmP 1
S.F. 143
SY. 1472
Cy. 2301
SY. 2561
S.Y. 1440
C. 210
Cy. 567
C. 160
GAL. 151
C.. 92
Ccy. 100
C.. 175
Ccy. 105
C.. 90
S.Y. 50
C.. 14
Ccy. 0.42
S.F. 6825
S.F. 571
S.F. 146
FT. 382
FT. 393
EACH 2
EACH 2
EACH 1
LumpP 1
LUmMP 1
FT. 27
S.F. 5
FT. 116
FT. 400
FT. 812
EACH 2
C.. 94
S.Y. 11500
EACH 6500
LUmMP 1
S.F. 137
LUmMP 1
Ccy. 2
C.. 21
S.F. 1625
LumP 1

Brumbaugh Construction, Inc.

Civil Solutions Associates, Inc.

June 7, 2022 Arcanum, OH Cincinnati, OH
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
cost cost cost cost cost cost

$10,000.00  $10,000.00 | $30,011.95 $30,011.95| $7,500.00 $7,500.00

$6,500.00  $6,500.00 | $6,250.00 $6,250.00| $2,500.00 $2,500.00
$3.00 $429.00 $2.50 $357.50|  $11.50 $1,644.50
$10.00  $14,720.00 $3.00 $4,416.00|  $11.73 $17,266.56
$20.00  $46,020.00 $22.00 $50,622.00  $19.00 $43,719.00
$1.00  $2,561.00 $1.00 $2,561.00 $5.75 $14,725.75
$1.00  $1,440.00 $1.00 $1,440.00 $5.75 $8,280.00
$60.00  $12,600.00 $66.00 $13,860.00|  $17.26 $3,624.60
$50.00  $28,350.00 $61.00 $34,587.00|  $95.12 $53,933.04
$70.00  $11,200.00 $63.00 $10,080.00|  $80.50 $12,880.00
$4.00 $604.00 $7.25 $1,094.75 $9.33 $1,408.83
$45.00  $4,140.00 $93.00 $8,556.00(  $87.50 $8,050.00
$55.00  $5,500.00 $96.00 $9,600.00|  $80.50 $8,050.00
$240.00  $42,000.00 $190.00 $33,250.00|  $235.35 $41,186.25
$250.00  $26,250.00 $238.00 $24,990.00|  $289.57 $30,404.85
$275.00  $24,750.00 $250.00 $22,500.00|  $430.25 $38,722.50
$60.00  $3,000.00 $95.00 $4,750.00|  $87.98 $4,399.00
$100.00  $1,400.00 $68.00 $952.00(  $92.35 $1,202.90
$2,500.00  $1,050.00 | $4,200.00 $1,764.00|  $14.38 $6.04
$8.00  $54,600.00 $7.35 $50,163.75 $8.05 $54,941.25
$12.00  $6,852.00 $26.25 $14,988.75|  $20.70 $11,819.70
$15.00  $2,190.00 $26.25 $3,832.50|  $23.00 $3,358.00
$18.00  $6,876.00 $45.00 $17,190.00 $8.05 $3,075.10
$75.00  $29,475.00 $52.00 $20436.00|  $59.18 $23,257.74
$1,200.00  $2,400.00 | $1,500.00 $3,000.00| $1,985.08 $3,970.16
$2,500.00  $5,000.00 | $3,200.00 $6,400.00| $3,595.81 $7,191.62
$1,500.00  $1,500.00 |  $2,555.00 $2,555.00| $3,447.59 $3,447.59
$4,500.00  $4,500.00 | $4,900.00 $4,900.00| $12,500.00 $12,500.00
$5500.00  $5,500.00 | $4,750.00 $4,750.00| $6,555.00 $6,555.00
$15.00 $405.00 $16.25 $438.75|  $10.00 $270.00
$30.00 $150.00 $17.00 $85.00 $5.00 $25.00
$5.00 $580.00 $3.70 $429.20 $1.00 $116.00
$5.00  $2,000.00 $2.10 $840.00 $1.00 $400.00
$5.00  $4,060.00 $2.10 $1,705.20 $1.00 $812.00
$500.00  $1,000.00 $65.00 $130.00|  $50.00 $100.00
$70.00  $6,580.00 $46.00 $4,324.00(  $135.00 $12,690.00
$3.00  $34,500.00 $0.90 $10,350.00 $1.25 $14,375.00
$1.00  $6,500.00 $1.00 $6,500.00 $1.00 $6,500.00
$2,500.00  $2,500.00 | $1,525.00 $1,525.00{ $2,000.00 $2,000.00
$12.00  $1,644.00 $5.45 $746.65|  $250.00 $34,250.00
$25,000.00 _$25,000.00 | $66,000.00 $66,000.00| $25,000.00 $25,000.00
$446,326.00 $482,932.00 $526,247.98 *1
$20.00 $40.00 No Bid $135.00 $270.00
$45.00 $945.00 No Bid $80.50 $1,690.50
$8.00  $13,000.00 No Bid $8.05 $13,081.25
$50,000.00 _$50,000.00 No Bid $85,000.00 $85,000.00
$63,985.00 No Bid $100,041.75
_$510,311.00 | No Bid ____$626,289.73 *2

*1 Total given was $527,872.98
*2 Total given was $627,914.73

Oheil Site Solutions

Centerville, OH
UNIT TOTAL
cost cost
$10,000.00 $10,000.00
$2,200.00 $2,200.00
$3.71 $530.53 *1
$2.04 $3,002.88 *2
$19.12 $43,995.12 *3
$2.03 $5,198.83 *4
$2.33 $3,355.20 *5
$50.00 $10,500.00
$58.20 $32,999.40 *6
$75.00 $12,000.00
$9.14 $1,380.14 *7
$179.35 $16,500.20 *8
$156.00 $15,600.00
$376.57 $65,899.75 *9
$407.14 $42,749.70 *10
$464.44 $41,799.60 *11
$143.00 $7,150.00
$214.29 $3,000.06 *12
$6,428.57 $2,700.00
$10.32 $70,434.00 *13
$12.26 $7,000.46 *14
$13.70 $2,000.20 *15
$52.36 $20,001.52 *16
$49.36 $19,398.48 *17
$2,800.00 $5,600.00
$3,100.00 $6,200.00
$3,000.00 $3,000.00
$1,000.00 $1,000.00
$4,500.00 $4,500.00
$14.81 $399.87 *18
$96.00 $480.00
$1.29 $149.64 *19
$1.33 $532.00 *20
$0.92 $747.04 *21
$65.00 $130.00
$58.51 $5,499.94 *22
$5.13 $58,995.00 *23
$1.00 $6,500.00
$1,500.00 $1,500.00
$14.60 $2,000.20 *24
$43,000.00 $43,000.00

No Bid
No Bid

*1 Total given was $530.00

*2 Total given was $3,000.00
*3 Total given was $44,000.00
*4 Total given was $5,200.00
*5 Total given was $3,350.00
*6 Total given was $33,000.00
*7 Total given was $1,380.00
*8 Total given was $16,500.00
*9 Total given was $65,900.00
*10 Total given was $42,750.00
*11 Total given was $41,800.00
*12 Total given was $3,000.00
*13 Total given was $70,400.00
*14 Total given was $7,000.00
*15 Total given was $2,000.00
*16 Total given was $20,000.00
*17 Total given was $19,400.00
*18 Total given was $400.00
*19 Total given was $150.00
*20 Total given was $530.00
*21 Total given was $750.00
*22 Total given was $5,500.00
*23 Total given was $59,000.00
*24 Total given was $2,000.00
*25 Total given was $579,600.00

Outdoor Enterprise, LLC|

Troy, OH

UNIT TOTAL
cost cost
$40,000.00 $40,000.00
$20,000.00 $20,000.00
$5.00 $715.00
$15.00 $22,080.00
$15.00 $34,515.00
$2.00 $5,122.00
$2.00 $2,880.00
$100.00 $21,000.00
$80.00 $45,360.00
$90.00 $14,400.00
$11.00 $1,661.00
$70.00 $6,440.00
$70.00 $7,000.00
$300.00 $52,500.00
$320.00 $33,600.00
$320.00 $28,800.00
$100.00 $5,000.00
$100.00 $1,400.00
$3,300.00 $1,386.00
$10.00 $68,250.00
$30.00 $17,130.00
$30.00 $4,380.00
$50.00 $19,100.00
$65.00 $25,545.00
$3,600.00 $7,200.00
$5,500.00 $11,000.00
$3,000.00 $3,000.00
$20,000.00 $20,000.00
$10,000.00 $10,000.00
$20.00 $540.00
$120.00 $600.00
$4.00 $464.00
$3.00 $1,200.00
$3.00 $2,436.00
$100.00 $200.00
$80.00 $7,520.00
$3.00 $34,500.00
$1.00 $6,500.00
$2,000.00 $2,000.00
$40.00 $5,480.00
$60,000.00 $60,000.00
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