ChoiceOne Engineering

Bid Tabulation Wells County Regional Sewer District BUNN In VTF Excavation LLC API Construction Corp Crosby Excavating, Inc Brackney, In J.G. Case Construction In Atlas Excavating, In Watson Excavating, In Murray Sanitary Sew Ft. Wavne, I Celina OF Lantto IN Fort Wayne I Brookville Muncie. West Lafavette Redkey, I January 7, 202 UNIT OF APPROX. TOTA TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTA TOTA TOTA TOTA NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST cos COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST **BASE BID** 1 105 CONSTRUCTION ENGINEERING, AS PER PLAN LUMP \$6,000.00 \$6,000.00 \$9.750.00 \$9,750.00 \$9.941.00 \$25,000.00 \$25,000,00 \$20.050.00 \$20.050.00 \$15,000.00 \$15,000.00 \$20,000.00 \$20,000.0 \$6.160.00 \$25,000.00 \$25,000.0 \$9.941.00 \$6.160.00 105 PRE-CONSTRUCTION VIDEO LUMP \$5.000.00 \$5,000.00 \$4.100.00 \$3.824.81 \$3.824.81 \$5.500.00 \$5,500.00 \$5.400.00 \$5,400.00 \$4.500.00 \$4.500.00 \$25,000,00 \$25,000.0 \$4.500.00 \$4,500,00 \$10,000.00 \$10,000.0 \$4.100.00 3 110 MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION LUMP \$50.000.00 \$50,000.00 \$56.823.06 \$56.823.06 \$128.700.00 \$128,700.00 165.000.00 \$165,000,00 \$100.000.00 \$100,000.00 \$85.000.0 145.525.00 \$145.525.00 \$100.000.00 \$100,000,00 \$61.199.45 \$61,199,45 \$85,000,00 201 CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN LUMP \$5,000.00 \$8,945.76 \$15,000.00 \$15,000.00 \$23,550.00 \$23,550.00 \$70,000.00 \$70,000.00 \$10,000.0 \$20,000.00 \$15,000.00 \$15,000.00 \$5,000.00 \$10,087.50 \$10,087.50 \$8,945,76 \$10,000.00 \$20,000.00 5 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP \$5,000,00 \$5,000,00 \$467.50 \$467.50 \$5.846.84 \$5.846.84 \$5,000.00 \$5,000.00 \$3.500.00 \$3,500.00 \$7,500.00 \$7.500.00 \$15,000.00 \$15,000.0 \$2,500.00 \$2,500,00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000.00 202 FENCE REMOVED AND REBUILT \$1.695.00 \$1.500.0 \$2,100,00 \$750.00 FT. 15 \$150.00 \$2,250,00 \$7.79 \$116.85 \$51.35 \$770.25 \$113.00 \$45.00 \$675.00 \$25.00 \$375.00 \$100.00 \$140.00 \$50.00 203 EXCAVATION, COMMON, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 112 \$20.00 \$2,240.00 \$11.13 \$1,246.56 \$19.76 \$2,213.12 \$10.00 \$1,120.00 \$60.00 \$6,720.00 \$10.00 \$1,120.0 \$60.00 \$6,720.0 \$22.00 \$2,464.00 \$5.00 \$560.00 LUMP 8 205 FROSION CONTROL \$20,000.00 \$20,000.00 \$15,292,50 \$15,292,50 \$3,900.60 \$3,900.60 \$2,500.00 \$2,500.00 \$55,000.00 \$55,000,00 17.500.00 \$17.500.00 \$25,000.00 \$25,000.0 \$25,000.00 \$25,000.00 \$7,000.00 \$7,000.00 9 207 SUBGRADE TREATMENT, TYPE 1 S.Y. 502 \$4.00 \$2.008.00 \$9.29 \$4.663.58 \$24.09 \$12.093.18 \$1.00 \$502.00 \$3.75 \$1.882.50 \$20.00 \$10.040.0 \$30.00 \$15.060.0 \$2.00 \$1.004.00 \$3.00 \$1.506.00 10 301 COMPACTED AGGREGATE NO 53 BASE AS PER PLAN TON 457 \$60.00 \$27,420,00 \$11.38 \$5,200,66 \$21 19 \$9 683 83 \$26.00 \$11.882.00 \$23.00 \$10 511 00 \$15.00 \$6,855,00 \$26.00 \$11 882 0 \$28.00 \$12 796 00 \$40.00 \$18 280 00 11 401 1-1/2" - 9.5MM, TYPE B, HMA SURFACE, PG64-22 TON 20 \$175.00 \$3,500.00 \$328.10 \$6.562.00 \$151.63 \$3,032,60 \$226.00 \$4.520.00 \$275.00 \$5,500.00 \$220.00 \$4,400.00 \$450.00 \$9,000.0 \$280.00 \$5,600,00 \$275.00 \$5,500.00 \$5,775.00 \$6,930.00 \$7,749.39 12 401 2-1/2" - 19ΜΜ TYPE R HMΔ INTERMEDIATE PG64-22 TON 33 \$175.00 \$234.83 \$141.13 \$4 657 20 \$169.50 \$5,593.50 \$200.00 \$6,600,00 \$200.00 \$6,600.00 \$325.00 \$10.725.0 \$210.00 \$250.00 \$8.250.00 13 406 TACK COAT @ 0.10 GAL./S.Y. GAL \$8.00 \$72.0 \$6.25 \$56.25 \$36.85 \$331.65 \$5.00 \$45.00 \$10.00 \$10.00 \$90.0 \$3.00 \$27.0 \$7.00 \$63.00 \$75.00 \$675.00 \$90.00 14 603 FENCE, TYPE CLTF, AS PER PLAN FT. 258 \$25.00 \$6,450.00 \$37.50 \$9,675,00 \$81.63 \$21,060,54 \$75.00 \$19.350.00 \$86.50 \$22,317,00 \$40.00 \$10.320.00 \$77.00 \$19.866.0 \$62.50 \$16,125,00 \$125.00 \$32,250.00 \$600.0 15 608 4" CONCRETE WALK REPLACED, IN-KIND S.F. \$12.00 \$144.00 \$13.91 \$166.92 \$29.89 \$358.68 \$11.50 \$138.00 \$55.00 \$10.00 \$120.0 \$50.00 \$252.00 \$3,024.0 \$5.00 \$60.00 12 \$660.0 \$150.00 \$225.00 16 611 MAILBOX REMOVED AND RESET. AS PER PLAN EACH \$265.00 \$2,120,00 \$150.00 \$4.600.00 \$1.000.00 \$100.00 \$800 O \$1.800.00 \$2,000.00 \$1,200,00 \$120.11 \$960.88 \$1,200,00 \$575.00 \$125.00 \$250.00 17 621 MULCHED SEEDING GRASS, TYPE 2, AS PER PLAN S.Y. \$23,000.00 \$54,625.00 \$23,000.00 \$69,000.0 \$66,700.00 \$34,500.00 11500 \$3.00 \$34,500.00 \$3.47 \$39,905.00 \$2.00 \$2.00 \$23,000.00 \$4.75 \$2.00 \$6.00 \$5.80 \$3.00 18 715 PIPE, TYPE 4, CIRCULAR, 4", 907.21 FT. 100 \$15.00 \$1,500.00 \$621.00 \$30.79 \$3,079.00 \$50.00 \$5,000.00 \$40.65 \$4,065.0 \$6.00 \$600.0 \$50.00 \$5,000.0 \$205.00 \$20,500.00 \$10.00 \$1,000.00 19 715 PIPE, TYPE 4, CIRCULAR, 6", 907.21 FT. 100 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$7.43 \$743.00 \$39.40 \$3,940.00 \$57.00 \$5,700.00 \$42.00 \$4,200.0 \$8.00 \$800.0 \$55.00 \$5,500.0 \$215.00 \$21,500.0 \$15.00 \$1,500.0 20 715 PIPE, TYPE 4, CIRCULAR, 8", 907.21 FT. 100 \$20.00 \$2,000.00 \$9.06 \$906.00 \$44.64 \$4,464.00 \$60.00 \$6,000.00 \$44.00 \$4,400.0 \$10.00 \$1,000.0 \$60.00 \$6,000.0 \$220.00 \$22,000.00 \$25.00 \$2,500.00 21 715 PIPE, TYPE 4, CIRCULAR, 10", 907,21 FT. 100 \$25.00 \$2,500.00 \$10.46 \$1.046.00 \$47.80 \$4.780.00 \$62.00 \$6,200,00 \$45.00 \$4.500.00 \$15.00 \$1.500.0 \$70.00 \$7,000.0 \$227.00 \$22,700.00 \$30.00 \$3.000.00 22 715 PIPE, TYPE 4, CIRCULAR, 12", 907.21 FT. 100 \$25.00 \$2,500.00 \$11.81 \$1,181.00 \$53.35 \$5,335.00 \$65.00 \$6,500.00 \$48.00 \$4,800.00 \$20.00 \$2,000.0 \$80.00 \$8,000.0 \$240.00 \$24,000.00 \$35.00 \$3,500.00 23 715 6" PVC SDR-35. STORM SEWER REPAIR, AS PER PLAN FT. \$20.00 \$380.00 \$38.50 \$731.50 \$145.91 \$2,772.29 \$40.00 \$760.00 \$70.00 \$1.330.00 \$10.00 \$190.0 \$250.00 \$4.750.0 \$210.00 \$3.990.0 \$75.00 \$1,425.00 19 24 715 8" PVC SDR-35, STORM SEWER REPAIR, AS PER PLAN \$160.00 FT. \$20.00 \$160.00 \$108.60 \$868.80 \$50.00 \$110.00 \$20.00 \$300.00 \$2,400.0 \$215.00 \$1,720.00 \$200.00 \$1,600.00 \$35.76 \$286.08 \$400.00 \$880.00 25 715 12" PVC SDR-35, STORM SEWER REPAIR, AS PER PLAN FT. \$70.00 \$1,000.00 \$30.00 \$350.00 \$2,800.0 \$220.00 \$1.760.00 \$300.00 \$2,400.00 \$25.00 \$200.00 \$53.54 \$428.32 \$91.78 \$734.24 \$560.00 \$125.00 \$240.0 FT. 26 715 4" SANITARY SEWER LATERAL, TYPE 1, AS PER PLAN 511 \$50.00 \$25,550.00 \$15,902.32 \$42,934.22 \$115.50 \$59,020.50 \$41,902.00 \$65.00 \$33,215.00 \$33,215.0 \$41,391.00 \$33,215.00 \$31.12 \$84.02 \$82.00 \$65.00 \$81.00 \$65.00 27 716 4" SANITARY SEWER LATERAL, TYPE 1, TRENCHLESS, HDD, AS PER PLAN FT. \$60.00 \$13,020,00 \$6,373,29 \$97.16 \$21.083.72 \$15.841.00 \$65.00 \$14.105.00 \$100.00 \$21,700.0 \$85.00 \$18,445.0 \$124.00 \$26,908.00 \$60.00 \$13.020.00 217 \$29.37 \$73.00 FT. 28 715 8" PVC SDR-35 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN \$80.00 \$207,499,20 \$373,200.00 \$250.044.00 \$559.800.00 3732 \$298,560,00 \$41.17 \$153,646,44 \$55.60 \$75.00 \$279,900,00 \$72.00 \$268,704,00 \$100.00 \$82.00 \$306.024.0 \$67.00 \$150.00 29 715 8" PVC SDR-21 SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN \$13,770,00 \$10.866.96 \$12,433,50 \$22,680.00 \$14.580.0 \$32,400.00 FT. 162 \$85.00 \$56.45 \$9.144.90 \$67.08 \$76.75 \$92.00 \$14.904.00 \$140.00 \$90.00 \$107.00 \$17.334.00 \$200.00 30 716 8" SANITARY SEWER INSTALLATION TRENCHLESS, JACK AND BORE, AS PER PLAN FT. 217 \$400.00 \$86,800,00 \$399.61 \$86,715,37 \$583.20 \$126,554,40 \$554.00 \$120,218,00 \$640.00 \$138.880.00 \$850.00 \$184,450.00 \$522.00 \$113.274.0 \$376.00 \$81.592.00 \$500.00 \$108,500.00 31 716 2" SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION, TRENCHLESS, HDD, AS PER PLAN FT. 1848 \$15.00 \$27,720,00 \$15.87 \$29.327.76 \$13.04 \$24.097.92 \$17.00 \$31,416,00 \$12.40 \$22,915,20 \$12.00 \$22.176.00 \$23.75 \$43.890.0 \$39.00 \$72,072,00 \$25.00 \$46,200.00 32 716 2" SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION, OPEN CUT, AS PER PLAN FT. 10 \$50.00 \$500.00 \$36.18 \$361.80 \$28.01 \$280.10 \$28.50 \$285.00 \$89.00 \$890.00 \$30.00 \$300.00 \$100.00 \$1,000.0 \$59.00 \$590.00 \$30.00 \$300.00 33 715 3" SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION, OPEN CUT, AS PER PLAN FT. 10 \$30.00 \$300.00 \$38.15 \$381.50 \$44.54 \$445.40 \$34.00 \$340.00 \$100.00 \$1,000.00 \$30.00 \$300.00 \$100.00 \$1,000.0 \$166.00 \$1,660,00 \$35.00 \$350.00 34 716 3" SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION TRENCHLESS HDD AS PER PLAN FT 4911 \$20.00 \$98 220 00 \$17.45 \$85,696,95 \$21.40 \$105 095 40 \$18.65 \$91 590 15 \$15.50 \$76 120 50 \$20.00 \$98 220 0 \$24.00 \$117.864.0 \$27.00 \$132.597.00 \$27.00 \$132 597 00 35 715 6" SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION OPEN CLIT AS PER PLAN FT. \$60.00 \$5,400,00 \$34.49 \$3 104 10 \$45.02 \$4.051.80 \$39.50 \$3.555.00 \$62.40 \$5.616.00 \$40.00 \$3,600.00 \$80.00 \$7,200.0 \$71.00 \$6,390,00 \$6,750.00 90 \$75.00 36 716 6" SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION, TRENCHLESS, HDD, AS PER PLAN FT. 5651 \$40.00 \$226,040.00 \$22.53 \$127,317.03 \$37.75 \$213,325.25 \$28.25 \$159,640,75 \$33.00 \$186,483.00 \$28.00 \$158,228.0 \$41.00 \$231,691.0 \$57.00 \$322,107.0 \$70.00 \$395,570.00 37 716 6" SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION. TRENCHLESS, JACK AND BORE, AS PER PLAN FT. \$400.00 \$25,850.00 \$12,500.00 50 \$20,000.00 \$25.26 \$1,263.00 \$982.36 \$49,118.00 \$601.50 \$30,075.00 \$37.50 \$1,875.00 \$200.00 \$10,000.0 \$475.00 \$23,750.0 \$517.00 \$250.00 38 716 1-1/2" GRINDER PUMP STATION FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION, OPEN CUT, AS PER PLAN 623 \$20.00 \$9.189.25 \$18.509.33 \$34.50 \$21,493,50 \$55.00 \$34.265.0 \$18 690 0 \$47.50 \$29.592.5 \$19,313.00 \$15.575.0 FT. \$12,460,00 \$14.75 \$29.71 \$30.00 \$31.00 \$25.00 39 716 1/1/2" GRINDER PUMP STATION FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION, TRENCHLESS, HDD, AS PER PLAN FT. \$31,787.50 \$53,403.0 2543 \$15.00 \$38,145.00 \$15.36 \$39,060.48 \$12.50 \$18.00 \$45,774.00 \$17.00 \$43,231.00 \$12.00 \$30,516.0 \$21.00 \$20.00 \$50,860.00 \$23.00 \$58,489,00 40 716 2" GRINDER PUMP STATION FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION, TRENCHLESS, HDD, AS PER PLAN \$100,092.48 \$17.00 \$175,467.0 \$129,693.00 \$190,725.00 FT. 7629 \$15.00 \$114,435.00 \$15.32 \$116,876.28 \$13.12 \$15.80 \$120,538.20 \$129,693.0 \$12.00 \$91,548.0 \$23.00 \$17.00 \$25.00 41 716 2" GRINDER PUMP STATION FORCEMAIN INSTALLATION, OPEN CUT, AS PER PLAN FT. 23 \$20.00 \$460.00 \$21.71 \$499.33 \$21.64 \$497.72 \$56.50 \$1,299.50 \$100.00 \$2,300.00 \$30.00 \$690.0 \$95.00 \$2,185.0 \$45.00 \$1,035.00 \$30.00 \$690.00 42 716 14" SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN CASING PIPE INSTALLATION, TRENCHLESS, HDD, AS PER PLAN FT. \$300.00 \$15,000.00 \$493.72 \$24.686.00 \$488.60 \$24.430.00 \$285.00 \$14.250.00 \$408.00 \$20,400.0 \$200.00 \$10.000.0 \$570.00 \$28,500.0 \$235.00 \$11.750.0 \$200.00 \$10.000.0 43 720 TYPE C, SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN \$4,500.00 \$72,000.00 \$4,099.06 \$65,584.96 \$8,981.39 \$143,702.24 \$4,000.00 \$64,000.00 \$5,100.00 \$81,600.0 \$4,200.00 \$67,200.0 \$4,750.00 \$76,000.0 \$6,300.00 \$100,800.00 \$2,000.00 \$32,000.0 44 720 TYPE C DROP SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN EACH \$8,000,00 \$8,000.00 \$7.204.00 \$7.204.00 \$7.550.09 \$7.550.09 \$5,000,00 \$5,000.00 \$14.350.00 \$14.350.00 \$6.500.00 \$6,500.0 \$5,500.00 \$5,500.0 \$10.700.00 \$10,700.00 \$3,500,00 \$3,500.00 45 720 TYPE D DROP SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE, INTERNAL DROP, AS PER PLAN EACH \$8.000.00 \$8.000.00 \$15.953.25 \$15.953.25 \$7.622.97 \$7.622.97 \$5.500.00 \$5,500.00 \$16.240.00 \$7.500.00 \$7,500.00 \$6.500.00 \$6.500.0 \$10.000.00 \$10.000.00 \$3,000,00 \$3,000.00 \$16,240,00 720 FORCEMAIN AIR RELEASE VALVE CHAMBER, AS PER PLAN EACH \$50,683.38 \$8,250.00 \$34,200.00 \$55.800.0 \$45,000.00 \$5,000.00 \$30.000.00 \$3,500.00 \$21,000,00 \$6,476,17 \$38.857.02 \$8,447,23 \$49,500,00 \$8,730.00 \$52,380.00 \$5,700.00 \$9.300.00 \$7.500.00 \$4,817.64 47 720 LOW PRESSURE FORCEMAIN END CLEANOUT CHAMBER, AS PER PLAN EACH \$3,500.00 \$3,500.00 \$4,155.75 \$4,155.75 \$4,817.64 \$4,000.00 \$4,000.00 \$4,300.00 \$4,300.00 \$3,000.00 \$3,000.00 \$3,500.00 \$3,500.0 \$5,500.00 \$5,500.00 \$2,000.00 \$2,000.00 48 801 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC, AS PER PLAN LUMP \$10,000.00 \$10,000,00 \$15,625.00 \$15,625.00 \$6,792.53 \$6,792.53 \$35,000.00 \$35,000.00 \$35,240.00 \$35,240.00 \$7.500.00 \$7,500.00 \$50,000.00 \$50,000.0 \$10,000.00 \$10,000.00 \$20,000.00 \$20,000.00 49 802 REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN AND REERECTION EACH \$250.00 \$257.71 \$250.00 \$575.00 \$100.00 \$200.00 \$225.00 \$2,500.00 \$5,000.00 \$500.00 \$116.88 \$233.76 \$515.42 \$500.00 \$1.150.00 \$1,000,00 \$2,000.0 \$450.00 50 SPEC CITY OF BLUFFTON SANITARY MANHOLE DISCHARGE CONNECTION LUMP \$2.500.00 \$2,500.00 \$4,363.55 \$5.750.00 \$4.230.00 \$7.000.00 \$7,000.00 \$5,000.0 \$4.500.00 \$4.500.00 \$3,000.00 \$3,000.00 \$1,786,10 \$1.786.10 \$4.363.55 \$5,750,00 \$4,230,00 \$5,000.00 LUMP 52 SPEC PLIMP STATION \$521,442,38 \$520,000.00 \$225,000.00 \$350,000.00 \$350.000.00 \$508.023.62 \$508.023.62 \$521,442,38 \$476.051.00 \$476,051,00 536.990.00 520.000.00 450.000.00 \$450,000.0 490.000.00 \$490,000.00 \$225,000.00 \$536,990.00 53 SPEC PUMP STATION ELECTRIC SERVICE (ALLOWANCE) LUMP \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.00 54 SPEC GRINDER PUMP STATION ELECTRIC SERVICE FT. \$137.500.00 \$155,265,00 \$105.875.00 \$165,000.00 \$101.750.00 \$220,000.00 5500 \$30.00 \$165,000,00 \$25.00 \$28.23 \$19.25 \$7.75 \$42,625,00 \$30.00 \$30.00 \$165,000.0 \$18.50 \$40.00 55 SPEC FORCEMAIN UTILITY MARKER EACH 25 \$200.00 \$5,000,00 \$148.38 \$3,709,50 \$29.15 \$728.75 \$75.00 \$1.875.00 \$35.00 \$875.00 \$125.00 \$3.125.00 \$100.00 \$2,500.00 \$150.00 \$3.750.00 \$250.00 \$6,250.00 56 SPEC FLOW METER CHAMBER LUMP \$30,000.00 \$30.000.00 \$35,700,76 \$35,700,76 \$25,300,21 \$25,300,21 \$62,100,00 \$62,100,00 \$41,000.00 \$41,000,00 \$40.000.00 \$40.000.00 \$30,000.00 \$30,000.0 \$90.000.00 \$90,000.00 \$5,000,00 \$5,000.00 57 SPEC_FLOW METER ELECTRIC SERVICE (ALLOWANCE) LUMP \$10,000.00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000.00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000.00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000.00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000.00 \$10,000.00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000.0 \$10,000.00 \$10,000.00 \$10,000,00 \$10,000.00 58 SPEC STANDBY GENERATOR LUMP \$35,000.00 \$35,000,00 \$40.625.00 \$40,625,00 \$34.837.24 \$34.837.24 \$42,000.00 \$42,000.00 \$40,680,00 \$40,680,00 \$52,000.00 \$52,000.00 \$35,000,00 \$35,000.0 \$44.400.00 \$44,400,00 \$175,000.00 \$175,000.00 59 SPEC ROCK EXCAVATION CY 50 \$100.00 \$5,000,00 \$103.75 \$5 187 50 \$85.13 \$4 256 50 \$195.00 \$9.750.00 \$115.00 \$5,750,00 \$120.00 \$6,000,00 \$300.00 \$15,000,0 \$115.00 \$5,750,00 \$150.00 \$7,500,00 60 SPEC SCADA SYSTEM LUMP \$50,000,00 \$50,000.0 \$625.00 \$625.00 \$1,399.32 \$1,399.33 \$8,700.00 \$8,700.00 \$9,165.00 \$9.165.0 \$8,000.00 \$8,000.0 \$7,000.00 \$7,000.0 \$9.000.00 \$9,000.0 \$35,000,00 \$35,000.0 \$1.814.619.08 \$2.183.364.04 \$2,341,714,20 \$2,331,648,0 TOTAL INCIDENTALS \$1,989,679,00 \$2,205,136,60 \$2,516,510,5 \$2,603,247,00 \$2,717,187,00 \$322,000 00 51 SPEC GRINDER PUMP STATION - LIBERTY PUMPS EACH 46 \$9.000.0 \$414,000.0 \$434 563 3 \$416 793 58 \$418,002,00 \$10,200.0 \$469 200 00 \$541 420 00 \$368,000 \$7,000.0 \$644,000,0 TOTAL BASE BID \$2,403,679,00 \$2,249,182,46 \$2,600,157,62 \$2,623,138,60 \$2,810,914,20 \$2,873,068,00 \$2,884,510,50 \$2,925,247,00 \$3,361,187,00 ALTERNATE #1 \$1,989,679.0 \$1.814.619.08 \$2.183.364.0 \$2,205,136,60 \$2.341.714.2 \$2,331,648,0 \$2,603,247.0 \$2.717.187.0 TOTAL INCIDENTALS 51A SPEC GRINDER PUMP STATION - FRANKLIN PUMPS EACH 46 \$9.000.00 \$414,000,00 \$9.650.78 \$443.935.88 \$8.959.75 \$412.148.50 \$10,000,00 \$460.000.00 \$10.430.00 \$479.780.00 \$12,535,00 \$576,610.0 No Bid \$6.950.00 \$319,700,00 \$14,000,00 \$644.000.0 \$2,665,136,60 \$2,908,258,0 \$2.258.554.96 \$2.595.512.54 \$2.821.494.20 \$2.922.947.0 \$3.361.187.0 TOTAL ALTERNATE #1 \$2,403,679,00 No Bid ALTERNATE #2 \$1.989.679.0 \$1.814.619.0 \$2 183 364 0 \$2 205 136 60 \$2 341 714 2 \$2 221 648 0 \$2 516 510 9 \$2 603 247 (\$2 717 187 (TOTAL INCIDENTALS 51B SPEC GRINDER PUMP STATION - BARNES PUMPS EACH \$9,000.0 \$414,000.00 \$411,965.88 \$376,596.48 \$400,200.0 \$448,500.0 \$12,200.00 \$561,200.0 \$8,000.00 \$368,000 \$6,150.00 \$282,900.0 \$14,000.00 \$644,000. TOTAL ALTERNATE #2 \$2,403,679.0 \$2,226,584.9 \$2,559,960.5 \$2,605,336.60 \$2,790,214.2 \$2,892,848.0 \$2,884,510.5 \$2,886,147.0 \$3,361,187. ALTERNATE #3 TOTAL INCIDENTALS \$1 989 679 0 \$1.814.619.0 \$2 183 364 0 \$2 205 136 60 \$2 341 714 2 \$2 331 648 0 \$2 603 247 0 \$2 717 187 0 51C SPEC GRINDER PUMP STATION - MYERS PUMPS EACH 46 \$9,000.0 \$414,000.0 10,263.28 \$472,110.8 \$9,459.91 \$451,260.00 \$11,085.00 \$509,910.0 No Bid \$7,450.00 \$342,700.0 \$644,000.0 TOTAL ALTERNATE #3 \$2,403,679,0 \$2,286,729,96 \$2,618,519,9 \$2,656,396,60 \$2 851 624 2 \$2,903,198,0 No Bid \$2,945,947,00 \$3,361,187,00

^{*1} Total given was \$282.50

^{*2} Total given was \$2,623,136.10