
  
REF. ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

BASE BID
1 201 CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $16,148.30 $16,148.30 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $13,755.19 $13,755.19 $10,260.00 $10,260.00 $30,812.00 $30,812.00
2 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $70,305.37 $70,305.37 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $958.10 $958.10 $30,850.00 $30,850.00 $46,997.85 $46,997.85
3 204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 4463 $3.00 $13,389.00 $0.61 $2,722.43 $1.00 $4,463.00 $0.44 $1,963.72 $4.00 $17,852.00 $1.20 $5,355.60
4 301 7" ASPHALT CONCRETE BASE, PG 64-22 C.Y. 265 $165.00 $43,725.00 $327.25 $86,721.25 $300.00 $79,500.00 $292.02 $77,385.30 $295.00 $78,175.00 $252.50 $66,912.50
5 304 AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 1508 $45.00 $67,860.00 $25.00 $37,700.00 $41.00 $61,828.00 $37.56 $56,640.48 $36.00 $54,288.00 $26.35 $39,735.80
6 407 TACK COAT FOR INTERMEDIATE COURSE, 0.06 GAL./S.Y. GAL. 250 $6.00 $1,500.00 $11.90 $2,975.00 $10.00 $2,500.00 $10.10 $2,525.00 $6.00 $1,500.00 $6.35 $1,587.50
7 410 TRAFFIC COMPACTED SURFACE, TYPE A OR B C.Y. 500 $35.00 $17,500.00 $32.51 $16,255.00 $39.00 $19,500.00 $107.70 $53,850.00 $36.00 $18,000.00 $37.00 $18,500.00
8 441 1-3/4" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2, (448) C.Y. 278 $180.00 $50,040.00 $327.25 $90,975.50 $285.00 $79,230.00 $292.02 $81,181.56 $295.00 $82,010.00 $252.50 $70,195.00
9 441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, PG 64-22 (448) C.Y. 177 $200.00 $35,400.00 $339.15 $60,029.55 $290.00 $51,330.00 $302.35 $53,515.95 $350.00 $61,950.00 $305.25 $54,029.25

9A 441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, PG 70-22M (448) C.Y. 57 $200.00 $11,400.00 $386.75 $22,044.75 $325.00 $18,525.00 $343.68 $19,589.76 $350.00 $19,950.00 $305.00 $17,385.00
10 452 6" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 43 $80.00 $3,440.00 $99.05 $4,259.15 $100.00 $4,300.00 $58.89 $2,532.27 $122.00 $5,246.00 $120.00 $5,160.00
11 607 FENCE, TYPE CLT FT. 34 $75.00 $2,550.00 $142.80 $4,855.20 $120.00 $4,080.00 $121.16 $4,119.44 $44.00 $1,496.00 $109.00 $3,706.00
12 608 CONCRETE WALK REPLACED, IN KIND S.F. 946 $12.00 $11,352.00 $11.47 $10,850.62 $16.00 $15,136.00 $7.53 $7,123.38 $14.50 $13,717.00 $10.00 $9,460.00
13 609 BARRIER CURB REPLACED, IN KIND FT. 101 $35.00 $3,535.00 $52.75 $5,327.75 $55.00 $5,555.00 $47.20 $4,767.20 $80.00 $8,080.00 $39.00 $3,939.00
14 609 COMBINATION CURB AND GUTTER REPLACED, IN KIND FT. 232 $35.00 $8,120.00 $58.72 $13,623.04 $63.00 $14,616.00 $50.95 $11,820.40 $80.00 $18,560.00 $39.00 $9,048.00
15 611 4" CONDUIT, TYPE C, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 1000 $12.00 $12,000.00 $1.80 $1,800.00 $7.00 $7,000.00 $16.32 $16,320.00 $13.60 $13,600.00 $15.50 $15,500.00
16 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE C, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 1000 $15.00 $15,000.00 $2.99 $2,990.00 $8.00 $8,000.00 $18.46 $18,460.00 $15.90 $15,900.00 $17.25 $17,250.00
17 611 8" CONDUIT, TYPE C, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 1000 $18.00 $18,000.00 $4.66 $4,660.00 $10.00 $10,000.00 $21.21 $21,210.00 $19.25 $19,250.00 $21.50 $21,500.00
18 611 4" CONDUIT, TYPE C, 707.33, STORM REPAIR FT. 1000 $12.00 $12,000.00 $1.64 $1,640.00 $6.00 $6,000.00 $12.12 $12,120.00 $15.60 $15,600.00 $15.25 $15,250.00
19 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE C, 707.33, STORM REPAIR FT. 1000 $15.00 $15,000.00 $2.48 $2,480.00 $7.00 $7,000.00 $13.42 $13,420.00 $17.00 $17,000.00 $16.50 $16,500.00
20 611 8" CONDUIT, TYPE C, 707.33, STORM REPAIR FT. 1000 $20.00 $20,000.00 $3.31 $3,310.00 $9.00 $9,000.00 $14.94 $14,940.00 $20.00 $20,000.00 $20.00 $20,000.00
21 611 4" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 29 $12.00 $348.00 $4.81 $139.49 $12.00 $348.00 $22.14 $642.06 $35.00 $1,015.00 $38.50 $1,116.50
22 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 15 $15.00 $225.00 $6.62 $99.30 $15.00 $225.00 $43.59 $653.85 $56.00 $840.00 $41.50 $622.50
23 611 8" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 36 $30.00 $1,080.00 $9.43 $339.48 $20.00 $720.00 $40.36 $1,452.96 $42.25 $1,521.00 $36.00 $1,296.00

23A 611 10" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 5 $30.00 $150.00 $33.32 $166.60 $25.00 $125.00 $63.76 $318.80 $55.00 $275.00 $50.00 $250.00
24 612 12" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.45, STORM REPAIR FT. 20 $40.00 $800.00 $30.00 $600.00 $30.00 $600.00 $58.92 $1,178.40 $37.00 $740.00 $51.00 $1,020.00
25 611 10" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.33, STORM REPAIR FT. 100 $22.00 $2,200.00 $7.77 $777.00 $23.00 $2,300.00 $16.20 $1,620.00 $30.00 $3,000.00 $46.00 $4,600.00
26 611 12" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.33, STORM REPAIR FT. 168 $40.00 $6,720.00 $22.27 $3,741.36 $28.00 $4,704.00 $35.01 $5,881.68 $41.00 $6,888.00 $38.50 $6,468.00
27 611 15" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.33, STORM REPAIR FT. 100 $50.00 $5,000.00 $10.17 $1,017.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $19.65 $1,965.00 $37.00 $3,700.00 $48.50 $4,850.00
28 611 18" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.33, STORM REPAIR FT. 100 $60.00 $6,000.00 $13.51 $1,351.00 $40.00 $4,000.00 $23.71 $2,371.00 $45.00 $4,500.00 $52.50 $5,250.00
29 611 6" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 707.12, STORM REPAIR FT. 5 $15.00 $75.00 $19.34 $96.70 $50.00 $250.00 $71.13 $355.65 $59.00 $295.00 $105.50 $527.50
32 611 12" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 706.02, STORM REPAIR FT. 100 $45.00 $4,500.00 $41.97 $4,197.00 $42.00 $4,200.00 $98.73 $9,873.00 $72.00 $7,200.00 $54.00 $5,400.00
33 612 15" CONDUIT, TYPE B, 706.02, STORM REPAIR FT. 10 $60.00 $600.00 $55.75 $557.50 $45.00 $450.00 $113.71 $1,137.10 $86.00 $860.00 $71.00 $710.00
34 611 6" SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 605 $50.00 $30,250.00 $41.83 $25,307.15 $55.00 $33,275.00 $58.58 $35,440.90 $81.60 $49,368.00 $89.00 $53,845.00
35 611 8" SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN FT. 5750 $60.00 $345,000.00 $84.59 $486,392.50 $70.00 $402,500.00 $71.78 $412,735.00 $78.70 $452,525.00 $112.00 $644,000.00
36 611 TYPE 3 SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN EACH 27 $3,500.00 $94,500.00 $4,267.50 $115,222.50 $2,900.00 $78,300.00 $4,244.18 $114,592.86 $3,520.00 $95,040.00 $4,210.00 $113,670.00
37 611 TYPE D SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN EACH 3 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $5,391.30 $16,173.90 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $4,948.16 $14,844.48 $5,300.00 $15,900.00 $4,787.00 $14,361.00
38 611 4" SANITARY SEWER LATERAL, AS PER PLAN FT. 1750 $50.00 $87,500.00 $52.19 $91,332.50 $75.00 $131,250.00 $93.83 $164,202.50 $84.00 $147,000.00 $106.50 $186,375.00
39 611 6" SANITARY SEWER LATERAL, AS PER PLAN FT. 370 $55.00 $20,350.00 $60.57 $22,410.90 $75.00 $27,750.00 $92.16 $34,099.20 $58.00 $21,460.00 $113.35 $41,939.50
40 611 6" HDPE SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLED BY HORIZONTAL DIRECTIONAL DRILLING, AS PER PLAN FT. 5946 $32.00 $190,272.00 $25.30 $150,433.80 $49.00 $291,354.00 $47.00 $279,462.00 $56.00 $332,976.00 $26.50 $157,569.00

40A 611 6" HDPE SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN INSTALLED BY HORIZONTAL DIRECTIONAL DRILLING THROUGH ROCK, AS PER PLAN FT. 4500 $157.00 $706,500.00 $87.98 $395,910.00 $88.00 $396,000.00 $120.60 $542,700.00 $84.00 $378,000.00 $155.00 $697,500.00
41 611 10" HDPE CASING PIPE INSTALLED BY HORIZONTAL DIRECTIONAL DRILLING, AS PER PLAN FT. 98 $100.00 $9,800.00 $75.95 $7,443.10 $90.00 $8,820.00 $163.80 $16,052.40 $91.00 $8,918.00 $93.00 $9,114.00
42 611 14" HDPE CASING PIPE INSTALLED BY HORIZONTAL DIRECTIONAL DRILLING, AS PER PLAN FT. 83 $100.00 $8,300.00 $111.77 $9,276.91 $210.00 $17,430.00 $206.45 $17,135.35 $133.00 $11,039.00 $126.00 $10,458.00
43 611 1-1/2" HDPE SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN,  FOR SERVICES, AS PER PLAN FT. 1035 $30.00 $31,050.00 $14.01 $14,500.35 $30.00 $31,050.00 $26.07 $26,982.45 $25.00 $25,875.00 $14.00 $14,490.00
44 611 2" HDPE SANITARY SEWER FORCEMAIN,  FOR SERVICES, AS PER PLAN FT. 763 $35.00 $26,705.00 $12.57 $9,590.91 $27.00 $20,601.00 $23.90 $18,235.70 $28.00 $21,364.00 $14.00 $10,682.00
45 611 AIR RELEASE VALVE CHAMBER, AS PER PLAN EACH 5 $5,000.00 $25,000.00 $7,149.90 $35,749.50 $7,500.00 $37,500.00 $9,661.54 $48,307.70 $12,165.00 $60,825.00 $6,565.00 $32,825.00
46 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $17,356.15 $17,356.15 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $26,271.64 $26,271.64 $47,750.00 $47,750.00 $23,796.00 $23,796.00
47 614 ASPHALT CONCRETE FOR MAINTAINING TRAFFIC C.Y. 120 $100.00 $12,000.00 $314.18 $37,701.60 $305.00 $36,600.00 $328.56 $39,427.20 $182.00 $21,840.00 $229.25 $27,510.00
48 616 WATER M. GAL 10 $50.00 $500.00 $11.90 $119.00 $5.00 $50.00 $25.82 $258.20 $64.00 $640.00 $236.85 $2,368.50
49 623 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $13,387.50 $13,387.50 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $12,887.60 $12,887.60 $15,570.00 $15,570.00 $13,431.00 $13,431.00
50 625 CONDUIT, 725.051, 3", AS PER PLAN FT. 41 $10.00 $410.00 $16.98 $696.18 $20.00 $820.00 $22.22 $911.02 $1.00 $41.00 $21.00 $861.00
51 625 CONDUIT, JACKED OR DRILLED, 725.052, 2", AS PER PLAN FT. 297 $30.00 $8,910.00 $12.47 $3,703.59 $28.00 $8,316.00 $22.22 $6,599.34 $20.00 $5,940.00 $29.50 $8,761.50
52 625 CONDUIT, JACKED OR DRILLED, 725.052, 3", AS PER PLAN FT. 55 $35.00 $1,925.00 $15.11 $831.05 $30.00 $1,650.00 22.22 $1,222.10 $25.00 $1,375.00 $31.50 $1,732.50
53 630 REMOVAL OF GROUND MOUNTED SIGN AND REERECTION EACH 3 $500.00 $1,500.00 $74.18 $222.54 $225.00 $675.00 $74.82 $224.46 $150.00 $450.00 $475.00 $1,425.00
54 638 CURB VALVE AND BOX, AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $500.00 $500.00 $565.25 $565.25 $650.00 $650.00 $268.31 $268.31 $740.00 $740.00 $1,137.00 $1,137.00
55 638 WATER WORKS, MISC. WATER MAIN RELOCATED, AS PER PLAN FT. 100 $75.00 $7,500.00 $107.66 $10,766.00 $180.00 $18,000.00 $201.55 $20,155.00 $89.00 $8,900.00 $176.00 $17,600.00
56 638 WATER WORKS, MISC. WATER MAIN RECONNECTED, AS PER PLAN EACH 5 $400.00 $2,000.00 $1,411.34 $7,056.70 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,009.53 $5,047.65 $1,875.00 $9,375.00 $1,461.00 $7,305.00
57 638 WATER WORKS, MISC. WATER SERVICE LINE RELOCATED, AS PER PLAN FT. 200 $45.00 $9,000.00 $21.26 $4,252.00 $35.00 $7,000.00 $17.14 $3,428.00 $31.00 $6,200.00 $50.00 $10,000.00
58 642 PAVEMENT MARKING MISCELLANEOUS REPAIR, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,950.00 $5,950.00 $3,750.00 $3,750.00 $6,060.00 $6,060.00 $5,470.00 $5,470.00 $2,368.00 $2,368.00
59 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS I, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 2000 $5.00 $10,000.00 $9.41 $18,820.00 $2.50 $5,000.00 $3.65 $7,300.00 $12.00 $24,000.00 $11.50 $23,000.00
60 832 STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN LUMP 1 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $1,576.75 $1,576.75 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $14,832.69 $14,832.69 $8,300.00 $8,300.00 $10,944.00 $10,944.00
61 832 EROSION CONTROL EACH 5000 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00
62 SPEC. ROCK EXCAVATION C.Y. 800 $100.00 $80,000.00 $98.77 $79,016.00 $85.00 $68,000.00 $146.35 $117,080.00 $122.00 $97,600.00 $104.00 $83,200.00
63 SPEC. CHURCH CAMP EXISTING TREATMENT SYSTEM TO BE ABANDONED LUMP 1 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $10,984.89 $10,984.89 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $8,041.92 $8,041.92 $16,745.00 $16,745.00 $12,398.00 $12,398.00
64 SPEC. GRINDER PUMP STATIONS, TYPE 1 EACH 2 $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $11,356.17 $22,712.34 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $8,157.85 $16,315.70 $13,445.00 $26,890.00 $10,452.00 $20,904.00
65 SPEC. GRINDER PUMP STATIONS, TYPE 2 EACH 2 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $13,023.96 $26,047.92 $7,200.00 $14,400.00 $9,550.94 $19,101.88 $15,720.00 $31,440.00 $10,131.00 $20,262.00
66 SPEC. GRINDER PUMP STATIONS, TYPE 3 EACH 1 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,932.33 $20,932.33 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $11,730.44 $11,730.44 $16,180.00 $16,180.00 $14,831.00 $14,831.00
67 SPEC. PUMP STATION (SUCTION LIFT) EACH 1 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $143,124.85 $143,124.85 $151,000.00 $151,000.00 $138,154.52 $138,154.52 $145,275.00 $145,275.00 $130,651.00 $130,651.00
68 SPEC. ELECTRIC SERVICE, GRINDER PUMP, TYPE 1 EACH 2 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,451.00 $6,902.00 $3,100.00 $6,200.00 $2,929.00 $5,858.00 $3,850.00 $7,700.00 $3,052.00 $6,104.00
69 SPEC. ELECTRIC SERVICE, GRINDER PUMP, TYPE 2 EACH 2 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $6,668.76 $13,337.52 $5,900.00 $11,800.00 $5,660.04 $11,320.08 $7,140.00 $14,280.00 $5,900.00 $11,800.00
70 SPEC. ELECTRIC SERVICE, GRINDER PUMP, TYPE 3 EACH 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,975.00 $2,975.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $2,525.00 $2,525.00 $3,360.00 $3,360.00 $2,631.00 $2,631.00
71 SPEC. ELECTRIC SERVICE, PUMP STATION EACH 1 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $28,762.30 $28,762.30 $27,000.00 $27,000.00 $24,916.70 $24,916.70 $30,100.00 $30,100.00 $25,445.00 $25,445.00
72 SPEC. UTILITY MARKING CROSSING EACH 14 $100.00 $1,400.00 $104.13 $1,457.82 $175.00 $2,450.00 $141.66 $1,983.24 $56.00 $784.00 $183.00 $2,562.00

LATERAL CONNECTIONS (OUTSIDE OF RIGHT OF WAY) $0.00
73 201 CLEARING AND GRUBBING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,793.30 $10,793.30 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $18,811.56 $18,811.56 $10,240.00 $10,240.00 $4,735.00 $4,735.00
74 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $12,585.44 $12,585.44 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $20,712.81 $20,712.81 $7,180.00 $7,180.00 $5,461.30 $5,461.30
75 202 SEPTIC TANK REMOVED EACH 89 $500.00 $44,500.00 $684.85 $60,951.65 $1,100.00 $97,900.00 $786.85 $70,029.65 $1,000.00 $89,000.00 $1,234.50 $109,870.50
76 204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 361 $3.00 $1,083.00 $0.61 $220.21 $2.00 $722.00 $0.44 $158.84 $4.00 $1,444.00 $1.20 $433.20
77 304 AGGREGATE BASE, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 114 $45.00 $5,130.00 $25.00 $2,850.00 $40.00 $4,560.00 $37.59 $4,285.26 $36.00 $4,104.00 $50.50 $5,757.00
78 407 TACK COAT FOR INTERMEDIATE COURSE, 0.06 GAL./S.Y. GAL. 14 $6.00 $84.00 $11.90 $166.60 $10.00 $140.00 $10.33 $144.62 $6.00 $84.00 $6.00 $84.00
79 441 1-3/4" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2, (448) C.Y. 11 $200.00 $2,200.00 $327.25 $3,599.75 $285.00 $3,135.00 $292.49 $3,217.39 $295.00 $3,245.00 $253.00 $2,783.00
80 441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, PG 64-22 (448) C.Y. 10 $220.00 $2,200.00 $339.15 $3,391.50 $290.00 $2,900.00 $301.50 $3,015.00 $360.00 $3,600.00 $305.25 $3,052.50
81 452 6" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 36 $80.00 $2,880.00 $92.69 $3,336.84 $100.00 $3,600.00 $79.50 $2,862.00 $122.00 $4,392.00 $94.75 $3,411.00
82 606 GUARDRAIL REMOVED AND RESET FT. 10 $100.00 $1,000.00 $33.98 $339.80 $245.00 $2,450.00 $46.30 $463.00 $28.40 $284.00 $80.50 $805.00
83 607 FENCE REMOVED AND REBUILT FT. 366 $35.00 $12,810.00 $13.23 $4,842.18 $156.00 $57,096.00 $20.55 $7,521.30 $35.00 $12,810.00 $47.00 $17,202.00
84 608 BRICK WALK REPLACED, IN-KIND S.F. 88 $50.00 $4,400.00 $23.31 $2,051.28 $40.00 $3,520.00 $30.30 $2,666.40 $40.00 $3,520.00 $28.00 $2,464.00
85 608 CONCRETE WALK REPLACED, IN KIND S.F. 762 $12.00 $9,144.00 $11.32 $8,625.84 $16.00 $12,192.00 $7.51 $5,722.62 $14.00 $10,668.00 $9.50 $7,239.00
86 611 4" SANITARY LATERAL SERVICE CONNECTION, AS PER PLAN FT. 6403 $70.00 $448,210.00 $25.91 $165,901.73 $42.00 $268,926.00 $31.31 $200,477.93 $29.00 $185,687.00 $41.00 $262,523.00
87 611 6" SANITARY LATERAL SERVICE CONNECTION, AS PER PLAN FT. 582 $75.00 $43,650.00 $38.42 $22,360.44 $45.00 $26,190.00 $39.22 $22,826.04 $36.00 $20,952.00 $56.50 $32,883.00
88 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS I, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 3500 $5.00 $17,500.00 $9.51 $33,285.00 $3.75 $13,125.00 $3.65 $12,775.00 $15.00 $52,500.00 $11.45 $40,075.00
89 SPEC. WALL REMOVED AND REBUILT, IN-KIND FT. 10 $250.00 $2,500.00 $77.92 $779.20 $179.00 $1,790.00 $132.22 $1,322.20 $205.00 $2,050.00 $237.00 $2,370.00
90 SPEC. REMOVE AND REPLACE PORCH AND STEP, IN-KIND S.F. 32 $300.00 $9,600.00 $35.68 $1,141.76 $114.00 $3,648.00 $118.64 $3,796.48 $107.00 $3,424.00 $104.00 $3,328.00
91 SPEC. LATERAL CONNECTION PERMIT FEES EACH 89 $140.00 $12,460.00 $191.67 $17,058.63 $115.00 $10,235.00 $167.78 $14,932.42 $240.00 $21,360.00 $151.50 $13,483.50

TOTAL $3,199,732.00 $2,693,037.79 $2,989,605.00 $3,143,099.00 $3,162,897.00 $3,513,750.00

ALTERNATE 1
67A SPEC PUMP STATION __________________ (SUBMERSIBLE) EACH 1 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $163,075.20 $163,075.20 $151,000.00 $151,000.00 $137,255.00 $137,255.00 $144,375.00 $144,375.00 $170,025.00 $170,025.00

ALTERNATE 1 TOTAL $350,000.00 $163,075.20 $151,000.00 $137,255.00 $144,375.00 $170,025.00

ALTERNATE 2
67B SPEC PUMP STATION __________________ (SUBMERSIBLE) EACH 1 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $174,547.99 174547.99 $181,000.00 $181,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 2 TOTAL $350,000.00 $174,547.99 $181,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 3
67C SPEC PUMP STATION __________________ (SUBMERSIBLE) EACH 1 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $142,339.45 $142,339.45 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 3 TOTAL $350,000.00 $142,339.45 $170,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 4
67D SPEC PUMP STATION __________________ (SUBMERSIBLE) EACH 1 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 4 TOTAL $350,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 5
67E SPEC PUMP STATION __________________ (SUBMERSIBLE) EACH 1 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 5 TOTAL $350,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

C.G. Construction & Utilities, Inc.
Miamisburg, OH

Brumbaugh Construction, Inc.
Arcanum, OHJune 11, 2020

Bid Tabulation
Municipality of West Milton
Ludlow Falls Sanitary Sewer VTF Excavation, LLC

Celina, OH 
Tom's Construction, Inc.

St. Henry, OH
Milcon Concrete, Inc.

Troy, OH 


