
  
REF. ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST

1 202 REMOVED, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
2 203  EMBANKMENT CONSTRUCTION, AS PER PLAN C.Y. 402 $25.00 $10,050.00 $18.00 $7,236.00 $14.10 $5,668.20
3 204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION S.Y. 196 $2.00 $392.00 $3.00 $588.00 $2.50 $490.00
4 304 AGGREGATE BASE C.Y. 42 $65.00 $2,730.00 $63.00 $2,646.00 $50.00 $2,100.00
5 441 2-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE INTERMEDIATE COURSE, TYPE 2, (448) C.Y. 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $340.00 $4,080.00 $250.00 $3,000.00
6 441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE SURFACE COURSE, TYPE 1, PG 64-22 C.Y. 7 $300.00 $2,100.00 $380.00 $2,660.00 $350.00 $2,450.00
7 452 9" NON-REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT S.Y. 27 $75.00 $2,025.00 $96.00 $2,592.00 $135.00 $3,645.00
8 611 8" C-900 DR-18 FORCEMAIN, AS PER PLAN FT. 53 $80.00 $4,240.00 $80.00 $4,240.00 $160.00 $8,480.00
9 611 10" SANITARY SEWER, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 5 $200.00 $1,000.00 $120.00 $600.00 $460.00 $2,300.00

10 611 12" SANITARY SEWER, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 61 $180.00 $10,980.00 $75.00 $4,575.00 $380.00 $23,180.00
11 611 15" SANITARY SEWER, 707.45, AS PER PLAN FT. 13 $200.00 $2,600.00 $140.00 $1,820.00 $390.00 $5,070.00
12 611 TYPE 3, SANITARY SEWER MANHOLE, AS PER PLAN EACH 1 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $14,300.00 $14,300.00
13 614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $300.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
14 623 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT STAKES AND SURVEYING, AS PER PLAN LUMP 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $1,400.00 $1,400.00
15 625 CONDUIT, 3", 725.04 FT. 71 $40.00 $2,840.00 $20.00 $1,420.00 $32.00 $2,272.00
16 659 SEEDING AND MULCHING, CLASS 1, AS PER PLAN S.Y. 950 $3.00 $2,850.00 $1.50 $1,425.00 $5.50 $5,225.00
17 SPEC FILL AND PLUG EXISTING CONDUIT FT. 132 $20.00 $2,640.00 $10.00 $1,320.00 $11.50 $1,518.00
18 SPEC LIFT STATION LUMP 1 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $198,248.00 $198,248.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00
19 SPEC EXISTING LIFT STATION ABANDONMENT LUMP 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
20 SPEC ROCK EXCAVATION C.Y. 60 $150.00 $9,000.00 $175.00 $10,500.00 $1.00 $60.00

TOTAL $242,547.00 $257,000.00 $264,158.20

ALTERNATE 1
18-1 SPEC LIFT STATION (FLYGT) LUMP 1 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $195,248.00 $195,248.00 $158,000.00 $158,000.00

ALTERNATE 1 TOTAL $242,547.00 $254,000.00 $262,158.20

ALTERNATE 2
18-2 SPEC LIFT STATION (MYERS) LUMP 1 $170,000.00 $170,000.00

ALTERNATE 2 TOTAL $242,547.00 No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 3
18-3 SPEC LIFT STATION (WEIR) LUMP 1 $170,000.00 $170,000.00

ALTERNATE 3 TOTAL $242,547.00 No Bid No Bid

ALTERNATE 4
18-4 SPEC LIFT STATION (CRANE/BARNES) LUMP 1 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $199,590.00 $199,590.00 $161,200.00 $161,200.00

ALTERNATE 4 TOTAL $242,547.00 $258,342.00 $265,358.20

ALTERNATE 5
18-5 SPEC LIFT STATION (OTHER) LUMP 1 $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $188,335.00 $188,335.00

ALTERNATE 5 TOTAL $242,547.00 $247,087.00 No Bid

December 5, 2019

Bid Tabulation
Village of Pandora

Lift Station Replacemence REBID Peterson Construction Co.
Wapakoneta, OH

Helms & Sons Excavating
Findlay, OH
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