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REF. ITEM
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION

1
2

3

CONTRACT A
SPEC 8" SANITARY SEWER REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN
SPEC 10" SANITARY SEWER REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN
CONTRACT ATOTAL

CONTRACT B
SPEC SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN
CONTRACT B TOTAL

MUNICIPALITY OF WEST MILTON
EMERICK ROAD SANITARY REHABILITATION

UNIT OF APPROX.
MEASURE oTY.
FT. 599
FT. 3305
VER. FT. 120

BID TABULATION
August 31, 2016
UNIT TOTAL UNIT
COST COST COST
$38.00 $22,762.00 $22.40
$50.00 $165,250.00 $23.20
$188,012.00 |
$366.75 $44,010.00 No Bid
$44,010.00

MILLER PIPELINE
INDIANAPOLIS, IN
TOTAL

COST

$13,417.60
$76,676.00

$90,093.60

No Bid

No Bid

INSITUFORM TECHNOLOGIES
LEBANON, OH

UNIT TOTAL
COST COST
$23.00 $13,777.00
$27.60 $91,218.00
$104,995.00

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

INSIGHT PIPE CONTRACTING
HARMONY, PA
UNIT TOTAL UNIT
COST COST COST
$28.75 $17,221.25 $28.00
$31.15 $102,950.75 $31.50
$120,172.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid

LAYNE
HILLIARD, OH
TOTAL
COST

$16,772.00
$104,107.50

$120,879.50

No Bid

No Bid

INLAND WATERS POLLUTION

DETROIT, MI

UNIT TOTAL
COST COST
$36.00 $21,564.00
$38.00 $125,590.00
$147,154.00

$137.00 $16,440.00
$16,440.00

CULY CONSTRUCTION
WINCHESTER, IN

LIQUIFORCE SERVICE
ROMULUS, MlI

UNIT TOTAL
COST COST
$34.00 $20,366.00
$40.00 $132,200.00
$152,566.00

No Bid No Bid
No Bid

UNIT TOTAL

COST COST

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

$208.00 $24,960.00
$24,960.00

ADVANCED REHABILITATION

BRYAN, OH

UNIT TOTAL

COST COST

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

$335.00 $40,200.00
$40,200.00

ADVANCED UNDERGROUND
WESTLAND, Ml

UNIT TOTAL
COST COST
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid

$290.00 $34,800.00
$34,800.00

*1 - Total given was $5,800.00.
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