
  
REF. ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

BASE BID
1 KLIPSTINE ROAD

203 EXCAVATION C.Y. 440 $15.00 $6,600.00 $21.55 $9,482.00 $23.00 $10,120.00 $44.00 $19,360.00
204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION S.Y. 987 $4.00 $3,948.00 $0.30 $296.10 $0.50 $493.50 $1.00 $987.00
204 EXCAVATION OF SUBGRADE AND STRUCTURAL EMBANKMENT C.Y. 82 $32.00 $2,624.00 $21.56 $1,767.92 $20.00 $1,640.00 $75.00 $6,150.00
254 1-1/2"± PAVEMENT PLANING, ASPHALT CONCRETE S.Y. 3240 $2.00 $6,480.00 $3.00 $9,720.00 $3.70 $11,988.00 $3.20 $10,368.00
304 12" AGGREGATE BASE C.Y. 330 $35.00 $11,550.00 $46.00 $15,180.00 $45.00 $14,850.00 $48.00 $15,840.00
407 TACK COAT GALS. 327 $4.00 $1,308.00 $5.30 $1,733.10 $4.00 $1,308.00 $2.50 $817.50
408 PRIME COAT GALS. 395 $4.00 $1,580.00 $7.75 $3,061.25 $4.75 $1,876.25 $4.00 $1,580.00
441 2-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE,

   TYPE 2, (448) TONS 138 $85.00 $11,730.00 $66.70 $9,204.60 $75.00 $10,350.00 $67.00 $9,246.00
442 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   9.5mm, TYPE A. PG 70-22M (448) TONS 351 $90.00 $31,590.00 $76.15 $26,728.65 $87.00 $30,537.00 $72.00 $25,272.00
614 MAINTAINING TRAFFIC LUMP 1 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,712.10 $1,712.10 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $11,549.70 $11,549.70

TOTAL    $78,910.00 $78,885.72 $86,162.75 $101,170.20

ALT 441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,
   TYPE 1, (448) - (REPLACES ITEM 442 ASPHALT CONCRETE) TONS 351 $90.00 $31,590.00 $69.78 $24,492.78 $75.00 $26,325.00 $69.00 $24,219.00
TOTAL WITH ALTERNATE 441 $78,910.00 $76,649.85 $81,950.75 $100,117.20

2 N. OLIVE ST. (ALLEY TO RR TRACKS)
203 EXCAVATION C.Y. 132 $15.00 $1,980.00 $21.55 $2,844.60 $23.00 $3,036.00 $44.00 $5,808.00
204 SUBGRADE COMPACTION S.Y. 265 $4.00 $1,060.00 $0.30 $79.50 $0.50 $132.50 $1.00 $265.00
204 EXCAVATION OF SUBGRADE AND STRUCTURAL EMBANKMENT C.Y. 22 $32.00 $704.00 $21.56 $474.32 $23.00 $506.00 $75.00 $1,650.00
254 1-1/2"± PAVEMENT PLANING, ASPHALT CONCRETE S.Y. 774 $2.00 $1,548.00 $3.00 $2,322.00 $4.50 $3,483.00 $3.20 $2,476.80
304 12" AGGREGATE BASE C.Y. 88 $35.00 $3,080.00 $46.00 $4,048.00 $45.00 $3,960.00 $48.00 $4,224.00
407 TACK COAT GALS. 58 $4.00 $232.00 $5.30 $307.40 $4.00 $232.00 $2.50 $145.00
408 PRIME COAT GALS. 106 $4.00 $424.00 $7.75 $821.50 $4.75 $503.50 $4.00 $424.00
441 2-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE,

   TYPE 2, (448) TONS 36 $85.00 $3,060.00 $66.70 $2,401.20 $75.00 $2,700.00 $67.00 $2,412.00
442 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   9.5mm, TYPE A. PG 70-22M (448) TONS 64 $90.00 $5,760.00 $76.15 $4,873.60 $87.00 $5,568.00 $72.00 $4,608.00
617 3" COMPACTED AGGREGATE, TYPE 411 STONE C.Y. 3 $200.00 $600.00 $246.83 $740.49 $125.00 $375.00 $80.00 $240.00

TOTAL    $18,448.00 $18,912.61 $87.00 $20,496.00 $22,252.80

ALT 441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,
   TYPE 1, (448) - (REPLACES ITEM 442 ASPHALT CONCRETE) TONS 64 $90.00 $5,760.00 $69.78 $4,465.92 $87.00 $5,568.00 $69.00 $4,416.00
TOTAL WITH ALTERNATE 441 $18,448.00 $18,504.93 $20,496.00 $22,060.80

3 HICKORY DRIVE OVERLAY
254 1-1/2"± PAVEMENT PLANING, ASPHALT CONCRETE S.Y. 375 $2.00 $750.00 $3.00 $1,125.00 $4.00 $1,500.00 $3.20 $1,200.00
407 TACK COAT @ 0.075 GAL./S.Y. GALS. 217 $4.00 $868.00 $5.30 $1,150.10 $4.00 $868.00 $2.50 $542.50
442 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   9.5mm, TYPE A. PG 70-22M (448) TONS 242 $90.00 $21,780.00 $76.15 $18,428.30 $87.00 $21,054.00 $72.00 $17,424.00
TOTAL $23,398.00 $20,703.40 $23,422.00 $19,166.50

ALT 441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,
   TYPE 1, (448) - (REPLACES ITEM 442 ASPHALT CONCRETE) TONS 242 $90.00 $21,780.00 $69.78 $16,886.76 $75.00 $18,150.00 $69.00 $16,698.00
TOTAL WITH ALTERNATE 441 $23,398.00 $19,161.86 $20,518.00 $18,440.50

4 E. WATER STREET FROM OLIVE TO WILLIAMSON ST.
254 1-1/2"± PAVEMENT PLANING, ASPHALT CONCRETE S.Y. 100 $2.00 $200.00 $3.00 $300.00 $7.80 $780.00 $3.20 $320.00
254 5" PAVEMENT PLANING, ASPHALT CONCRETE S.Y. 230 $2.50 $575.00 $3.00 $690.00 $7.80 $1,794.00 $6.50 $1,495.00
407 TACK COAT GALS. 52 $3.00 $156.00 $5.30 $275.60 $4.00 $208.00 $2.50 $130.00
442 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   9.5mm, TYPE A. PG 70-22M (448) TONS 122 $90.00 $10,980.00 $76.15 $9,290.30 $87.00 $10,614.00 $72.00 $8,784.00
TOTAL $11,911.00 $10,555.90 $13,396.00 $10,729.00

ALT 441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,
   TYPE 1, (448) - (REPLACES ITEM 442 ASPHALT CONCRETE) TONS 122 $90.00 $10,980.00 $69.78 $8,513.16 $75.00 $9,150.00 $69.00 $8,418.00
TOTAL WITH ALTERNATE 441 $11,911.00 $9,778.76 $11,932.00 $10,363.00

5 ALLEY NORTH OF E. MAIN  RUNNING EAST AND WEST BETWEEN STEFFIN ST. AND SECOND ST. (HALF BLOCK)
202 CONCRETE PAVEMENT REMOVED S.F. 270 $8.00 $2,160.00 $4.77 $1,287.90 $2.25 $607.50 $2.50 $675.00
203 EXCAVATION C.Y. 72 $15.00 $1,080.00 $21.55 $1,551.60 $23.00 $1,656.00 $44.00 $3,168.00
304 GRAVEL PREPARATION AND GRADING S.Y. 260 $5.00 $1,300.00 $6.90 $1,794.00 $1.00 $260.00 $1.00 $260.00
304 6" AGGREGATE BASE C.Y. 43 $60.00 $2,580.00 $46.00 $1,978.00 $58.00 $2,494.00 $48.00 $2,064.00
407 TACK COAT GALS. 39 $2.50 $97.50 $5.30 $206.70 $4.00 $156.00 $2.50 $97.50
441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   TYPE 1, (448) TONS 22 $95.00 $2,090.00 $69.78 $1,535.16 $87.00 $1,914.00 $98.00 $2,156.00
441 2-1/2"ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE,

   TYPE 2, (448) TONS 36 $90.00 $3,240.00 $66.70 $2,401.20 $87.00 $3,132.00 $67.00 $2,412.00
TOTAL    $12,547.50 $10,754.56 $10,219.50 $10,832.50

6 ALLEY TO NORTH OF E. WARD ST.  RUNNING EAST AND WEST BETWEEN SECOND ST. AND N. STEFFIN ST.
202 CONCRETE PAVEMENT REMOVED S.F. 60 $20.00 $1,200.00 $4.77 $286.20 $2.25 $135.00 $2.50 $150.00
203 EXCAVATION C.Y. 11 $50.00 $550.00 $21.55 $237.05 $23.00 $253.00 $44.00 $484.00
304 GRAVEL PREPARATION AND GRADING S.Y. 390 $5.00 $1,950.00 $6.90 $2,691.00 $1.00 $390.00 $1.00 $390.00
304 6" AGGREGATE BASE C.Y. 7 $60.00 $420.00 $46.00 $322.00 $58.00 $406.00 $48.00 $336.00
407 TACK COAT GALS. 58 $2.50 $145.00 $5.30 $307.40 $4.00 $232.00 $2.50 $145.00
441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   TYPE 1, (448) TONS 32 $95.00 $3,040.00 $69.78 $2,232.96 $87.00 $2,784.00 $98.00 $3,136.00
441 2-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE,

   TYPE 2, (448) TONS 54 $90.00 $4,860.00 $66.70 $3,601.80 $87.00 $4,698.00 $67.00 $3,618.00
TOTAL    $12,165.00 $9,678.41 $8,898.00 $8,259.00

BASE BID TOTAL $157,379.50 $149,490.60 $162,594.25 $172,410.00

BASE BID TOTAL WITH ALTERNATE 441 $157,379.50 $144,528.37 $154,014.25 $170,073.00

ALTERNATE NO. 1
A1 ALLEY NORTH OF GREENLAWN RUNNING EAST TO WEST BETWEEN WEST ST. AND CHESTNUT ST.

203 EXCAVATION C.Y. 5 $100.00 $500.00 $21.55 $107.75 NO BID $50.00 $250.00
304 GRAVEL PREPARATION AND GRADING S.Y. 190 $5.00 $950.00 $6.90 $1,311.00 NO BID $5.00 $950.00
304 6" AGGREGATE BASE C.Y. 3 $60.00 $180.00 $46.00 $138.00 NO BID $50.00 $150.00
407 TACK COAT GALS. 28 $2.50 $70.00 $5.30 $148.40 NO BID $2.50 $70.00
441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   TYPE 1, (448) TONS 16 $95.00 $1,520.00 $69.78 $1,116.48 NO BID $98.00 $1,568.00
441 2-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE,

   TYPE 2, (448) TONS 26 $90.00 $2,340.00 $66.70 $1,734.20 NO BID $98.00 $2,548.00
ALTERNATE NO. 1 TOTAL $5,560.00 $4,555.83 NO BID $5,536.00

ALTERNATE NO. 2
A2 ALLEY NORTH OF GREENLAWN RUNNING EAST TO WEST BETWEEN WASHINGTON AND CHESTNUT ST.

203 EXCAVATION C.Y. 86 $30.00 $2,580.00 $21.55 $1,853.30 NO BID $50.00 $4,300.00
304 GRAVEL PREPARATION AND GRADING S.Y. 367 $3.00 $1,101.00 $6.90 $2,532.30 NO BID $5.00 $1,835.00
304 6" AGGREGATE BASE C.Y. 52 $60.00 $3,120.00 $46.00 $2,392.00 NO BID $50.00 $2,600.00
407 TACK COAT GALS. 56 $3.00 $168.00 $5.30 $296.80 NO BID $2.50 $140.00
441 1-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, SURFACE COURSE,

   TYPE 1, (448) TONS 32 $95.00 $3,040.00 $69.78 $2,232.96 NO BID $90.00 $2,880.00
441 2-1/2" ASPHALT CONCRETE, INTERMEDIATE COURSE,

   TYPE 2, (448) TONS 52 $90.00 $4,680.00 $66.70 $3,468.40 NO BID $90.00 $4,680.00
ALTERNATE NO. 2 TOTAL    $14,689.00 $12,775.76 NO BID $16,435.00
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