
  
ITEM UNIT OF APPROX. UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION MEASURE QTY. COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

BASE BID
SPEC SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN VER. FT. 713.48 $280.00 $199,774.40 $110.00 $78,482.80 $190.00 $135,561.20 $202.00 $144,122.96 $205.00 $146,263.40 $226.00 $161,246.48 $243.00 $173,375.64 $288.84 $206,081.56

BASE BID TOTAL $199,774.40 $78,482.80 $135,561.20 $144,122.96 $146,263.40 $161,246.48 $173,375.64 $206,081.56

ALTERNATE 1
SPEC SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN VER. FT. 713.48 $280.00 $199,774.40 $230.00 $164,100.40 $160.00 $114,156.80 $151.00 $107,735.48 $225.00 $160,533.00 $260.00 $185,504.80 No Bid $243.93 $174,039.18

ALTERNATE 1 TOTAL $199,774.40 $164,100.40 $114,156.80 $107,735.48 $160,533.00 $185,504.80 $174,039.18

ALTERNATE 2
SPEC SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN VER. FT. 713.48 $280.00 $199,774.40 $85.00 $60,645.80 $268.00 $191,212.64 $121.00 $86,331.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid $321.35 $229,276.80

ALTERNATE 2 TOTAL $199,774.40 $60,645.80 $191,212.64 $86,331.08 $229,276.80

ALTERNATE 3
SPEC SANITARY MANHOLE REHABILITATION, AS PER PLAN VER. FT. 713.48 $280.00 $199,774.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $400.00 $285,392.00

ALTERNATE 3 TOTAL $199,774.40 $285,392.00
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